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FALL I S U E  

Come Join Software AG at "Windows on Tomorrow" 
The 20th International Software AG 
Users' Conference, October 22-26, 
1989, in Anaheim, California, 
promises to be our biggest and best 
ever ! 

You'll see the people and products 
that have made Software AG's 
Users' Conferences the most popu- 
lar in the world! You'll have front- 
row seats as Software AG again 
demonstrates the technologies and 
services that have made us the 
world's leading software manufac- 
turer for the last 20 years. 

Our 20th International Users' Con- 
ference in Anaheim coincides with 
the 20th Anniversary of Software 
AG, formed in Darmstadt, West 

Germany, in 1969. Software AG's 
20th Anniversary also coincides 
with the 20th anniversary of the 
independent software industry, 
initiated when IBM first "unbun- 
dled" software offerings from its 
hardware product twenty years ago. 

A Learning Experience: 4 Days of 
Presentations, Demonstrations, 
and Classes 

We'll be opening the "Windows on 
Tomorrow" at a wide variety of 
sessions, workshops, presentations 
and classes during the 20th Iriter- 
national Users' Conference! As 
attendees from past conferences 
know, these four days in October 

PREDICT CASE: An Integrated 4th 
Generation CASE Solution 
Greg Hagen 
Product Manager 

Business' create system develop- 
ment environments through the 
purchase of hardware and software, 
the rental or purchase of facilities, 
the hiring and training of staff, and 
the implementation of corporate 
policies. The major objectives for 
this effort are to establish an envi- 
ronment where their staff can work 
productively in the creation of 
quality systems that: 

Are cost effective 

(e.g., minimize development costs 
and meet the schedule). Current 
application portfolios would be in 
much better shape if well known 
Software Engineering Practices had 
been followed during their develop- 
ment. However, even the best inten- 
tions are often sidetracked by the 
harsh realities of limited budgets, 
lack of qualified personnel, and 
tight schedules that are seemingly 
cast in concrete. 

I There seem to be two extremes in 
our approaches to developing sys- 
tems. The first might be character- 

Perform as expected, when ex- ized as followings "Waterfall" 
~ e c t e d ,  and Lifecycle model. Such a proiect 

works through a set of phasks (e.g., ' Are to in Project Definition, Requirements, 
to changes in the business or etc.) attempting to produce and 
technical environment. validate a set of deliverables for 

Unfortunately, most of these objec- each phase. 
tives are seldom achieved. Often 
development focuses on only one 
or two of the full set of objectives continued on page 8 
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provide a wealth of technical infor- 
mation about Software AG products 
and directions. 

You can attend daily general ses- 
sions; see user presentations on 
unique applications and solutions 
to problems that your organization 
might also face; hear Software AG 
product managers describe the new 
functionality of products you're 
using; and interact with the other 
2,000 international users! 

Demo Room: Creating Business 
Solutions for Your Organization 

We have further expanded and en- 
hanced the popular Demo Room 
facilities this year to provide an 
unique set of demos giving you an 
insight into our latest products and 
versions on a variety of operating 
systems. 

New this year is the online regis- 
tration system for the Demo Room. 
You'll be able to register to see any 
demo you want through the "Reach 
Out & CON-NECT" system. 

It is Software AG's intention to .- 
provide a different focus in this k " -& 
year's product demonstrations. 
Each demo will address the actual 
application of Software AG tech- 
nology to business problems faced 
by organizations like yours. 

"Ask Software AG!" 

To fulfill the promise of "Windows 
on Tomorrow", we'll open the win- 
dows on your views, opinions, and 
questions during the Software AG 
Open Forum. As always, this forum 
provides an unique opportunity to 
address your comments directly 
to Software AG leading executives 
and developers, and offer observa- 
tions that we may use in  future 
development of products and 
services. 

continued on page 14 



President's Message 

1 Bill Wagner I 
As the days start getting shorter, as 

I 
the students start back to school, 
and as the Cubs fade into the 
depths of the NL East, the time 
comes to start thinking about the 
upcoming Software AG conference 
in Anaheim. For all  of us, these 
yearly events are exciting times full 
of new product announcements, 
new ideas, new speculations, and 
renewed friendships. For some, 
there is an extra element of antici- 
pation: awaiting the results of this 
year's SAGGROUP elections. 

The individuals who have chosen 
to run for office share two common 
traits: they each have a vision of 
how to strengthen the relationship 
between Software AG and their 
clients, and they each have made 
the commitment of volunteering 
their time and effort to make that 
vision a reality. Their nomination 
statements appear in  this issue of 
CONNECTIONS. I urge you to read 
and reflect on  these statements, 
using the candidates' goals as the 
main criteria to determine who will 
receive your votes. All of the can- 
didates are well qualified and capa- 
ble people, and all of them have 
made significant contributions to 
SAGGROUP i n  the past. This elec- 
tion, however, is not about the past 
but about the future. Your votes 
will  help determine the shape of 
that future. 

Elections are not the only confer- 
ence activity with a direct effect on 
the future of the user community. 
For all of the SIGs (and many of the 
BIGs), the conference is the only 
time of the year when members 
have the opportunity to meet, plan, 
exchange ideas, and conduct busi- 
ness. The SIGs and BIGs each have 
organizational meetings scheduled 
for Tuesday evening at the confer- 
ence. In addition, each of the SIGs 
will host a workshop during one 
of the conference sessions. A list of 
both SIGs and BIGs appears at the 

f back of each issue of CONNEC- 
TIONS. I urge each of you to use I continued on page 24 
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NATURAL ISPF: A NEW DIMENSION 
IN PRODUCTIVITY 
Barry Warwick 
Product Manager 

NATURAL ISPF (Integrated Struc- 
tured Programming Facility) is an 
integrated programming and main- 
tenance environment designed to 
meet the needs of the application 
developer and system programmer. 
Using NATURAL PROCESS as the 
base technology, NATURAL ISPF 
users have access to a full compli- 
ment of integrated facilities such as 
data set maintenance, PDS member 
editing, operating system informa- 
tion, ADABAS access, and access 
to Panvalet and Librarian source. 
NATURAL ISPF also provides the 
user with a new, standardized edi- 
tor for NATURAL as well as non- 
NATURAL object editing. 

NATURAL ISPF's extended split- 
screen capability provides a solu- 
tion which unites different NATU- 
RAL ISPF objects within a single 
screen image. For example, data- 
bases may be viewed online using 
NATURAL views while the NATU- 
RAL program is edited interactively, 
and the results may be routed to 
the workpool for testing and 
debugging. 

Any NATURAL ISPF object (e.g. 
NATURAL programs, PDS member, 
etc.) may be exported to or im- 
ported from a PC when NATURAL 
CONNECTION is installed. In addi- 
tion, the NATURAL ISPF interface 
to Software AG's office automation 
system, CON-NECT, allows the 
transfer of files or documents from 
one environment to another. 

Extended ISPF-Functionality for 
Heterogenous Environments 

In order for an organization to 
achieve increased productivity, a 
set of tools must be provided that 
encompass a wide array of inte- 
grated functionality while provid- 
ing an environment that is both 
comfortable and familiar. This ap- 
proach should not be based on a 
particular teleprocessing or data 
communications facility, but should 
allow the flexibility to span multiple 
environments to ensure maximum 

system productivity using mini- 
mum system resources. 

NATURAL ISPF supports this con- 
cept by delivering a set of tools 
that include an ISPF-like editor. 
With this single editor a uniform 
syntax is adhered to for editing 
of programs and other sources, in- 
dependent of programming lan- 
guage used or type of source being 
edited. Compliant with existing 
standards, it can be used to edit 
PDS members, prepare JCL, browse 
JOB SYSOUT or object lists such 
as VTOC's and the like. Additional 

comfort is provided by extending 
the editor functionality to support 
special object-specific commands 
such as Stow, Check, Run, Cat, and 
Struct when editing NATURAL 
objects. 

Full Networking Capabilities 

NATURAL ISPF, working in con- 
junction with NET-WORK, can be 
utilized to monitor and maintain 
NATURAL ISPF objects even when 
these are located on another CPU, 
physical machine or at a remote 

continued on page 4 

VMS Customers-See What's in 
Store for You at Anaheim! 
If you attended the Software AG 
VMS Special Interest Group (SIG) 
meeting at the University of Hous- 
ton this past March, you were given 
a close look at many of the technical 

we'll make available a separate, 
special break-out room for VAX 
users-for meeting other VAX cus- 
tomers, leaving and picking up  
messages, and just relaxing. 

But this year at our 20th Interna- 
tional Users' Conference in Ana- 
heim, California, Software AG's 
VAX customers will witness much 
more than technical presentations 
about Software AG's growing VAX 
product line-they will benefit 
from nearly 40 sessions describing 
the practical application of these 
products to solve business 
problems. 

and product-internal advances in 
Software AG'x VAX product line. 

Why Come to Anaheim? 

What's On the VAX Agenda? 

Unlike the Users' Conferences of 
previous years, this year's confer- 
ence, "Windows on Tomorrow," 
will focus less on how our products 
are constructed, and more on how 
they are applied in organizations 
like yours, to address problems you 
face. 

We'll be offering more education, 
workshops, hands-on training, and 
expanded product demonstrations; 
there will be more Software AG 
VMS developers to meet and inter- 
act with; and, for the first time, 

We'll start each morning with a 
VMS-specific General Session. 
These General Session presenta- 
tions will include addresses by re- 
nowned experts in the Digital 
arena; and discussions of "Open 
ISA for VMS," "CASE Strategy for 
VAX," and "Workstation and OLTP 
Strategy," presented by Software 
AG executives. 

Then, in separate, dedicated "VAX 
Tracks" offered exclusively for our 
VAX customers, you'll see presen- 
tations addressing cutting-edge 
issues: 

Portable, Commercial OLTP Ap- 
plications on DECIVAX 

Workstation Concepts for DECI 
VAX Environments 

a CASE Tools for VAX Application 
Implementation 

Office Automation with DECI 
VAX 

continued on page 9 



ISPF 
continued from page 3 

location. Maintenance activities 
across all computing nodes of a 
network from a host processor op- 
timizes the users productivity. 
Rather than having the requirement 
of logging on to each system sepa- 
rately, the user merely identifies to 
NATURAL ISPF which computer 
nodes is to be accessed. 

Operates across multiple 
Teleprocessing and Operating 
System Environments 

In order to provide a tool to be used 
to its fullest by application devel- 
opers, system maintenance groups 
or end-users, this tool must not be 
dedicated solely to a single telepro- 
cessing or operating system. NAT- 
URAL IPSF runs in any NATURAL 
environment. That environment 
may be COM-PLETE, CICS, IMSI 
DC, TSO, CMS or Batch. Therefore, 
NATURAL ISPF can become the 
standard user interface in an orga- 
nization regardless of the operating 
systems or the teleprocessing moni- 
tors being used. 

Full Access to Conventional 
Datasets, Library Management 
Systems and System Information 

NATURAL ISPF provides access to 
NATURAL and conventional data- 
sets such as sequential or parti- 
tioned datasets, and library 
management systems such as Pan- 
valet and Librarian. The NATURAL 
objects maintenance facility allows 
a full range of functions including 
displaying a list of members from a 
NATURAL library Members may 
be selected from the list by name, 
type or status for edit, browse, de- 
lete, catalog or uncatalog operations 
or to display information about a 
particular member. 

A full range of NATURAL com- 
mands are available, as well as ac- 
cess to the NATURAL Macro 
facility for using dynamic substitu- 
tion of variables in NATURAL 
programs. 

The PDS object maintenance allows 
listing datasets by prefix, volume 
or members of a dataset; edit, 
browse, delete, rename and copy 
capabiIities; online dataset 

f compression; job submission and 
job status cbcking including noti- 

4 fication and access to a job's sysout. 

Other dataset mainienance include 
online dataset allocations and cata- 
log or uncatalog functions. NATU- 
RAL ISPF also provides access to 
Panvalet and Librarian libraries, 
offering the same functionality as 
for PDS members. 

Integrated Environment for 
Interactive Application 
Development and System 
Maintenance 

Application development and sys- 
tem maintenance requires having 
access to differing environments 
and resources in order to fulfill 
tasks such as: 

--Development of applications in 
NATURAL 

-Access to existing programs 
and subprograms written in 
3rd generation Languages or 
Assembler 

-Testing of programs 

-Development of documentation 
such as technical or user man- 
uals and installation 
documentation 

As a NATURAL application, NAT- 
URAL ISPF offer its users a single, 
east-to-use environment in order 
to have 

-One uniform editor to edit JCL, 
documentation, or programs 
independent of their program- 
ming language 

-Facilities to test NATURAL 
programs and applications 
without leaving NATURAL 
ISPF 

-Maintenance of datasets and 
catalogs 

-Access to job information, in- 
cluding job activities and 
sysout 

-System operation capabilities 
like monitoring the SYSLOG, 
displaying the operator console 
or issuing operator commands 

4th Generation Technology 
Common User Access 

With its integration into the 4th 
Generation Technology, NATURAL 
ISPF enhances the usage of its ob- 
jects. Any of these objects, such 
as NATURAL source, PDS mem- 
bers, and sysout lists can be 
exported as documents using 
Software AG's office automation 
system CON-NECT. Conversely, 

CON-NECT documents imported to 
NATURAL ISPF can be stored in 
NATURAL or PDS Libraries or as 
sequential datasets. 

If NATURAL CONNECTION is 
used, files can be transferred be- 
tween the PC and NATURAL ISPF 
using the IMPORT and EXPORT 
direct commands. Existing NATU- 
RAL applications can be included 
in NATURAL ISPF by simply 
adapting the supplied menus. 

The integration of NATURAL PRO- 
CESS technology provides NATU- 
RAL ISPF with access to operating 
system and services. The use of 
NET-WORK allows NATURAL ISPF 
to access objects even if they are 
located on different physical 
machines. 

Enhanced Split-Screen 
Management System 

NATURAL ISPF provides enhanced 
multi-session and split-screen ca- 
pabilities to work with a large 
number of objects in parallel active 
sessions. These objects can be cop- 
ied across the boundaries of active 
sessions. Easy switching between 
the sessions is controlled by a sin- 
gle command or keystroke. 

The capability of suspending any 
active NATURAL ISPF session and 
return to them later delivers in- 
creased productivity in 
development. 

Enforcing Company-wide User 
Access Standards 

NATURAL ISPF provides a com- 
prehensive online HELP facility 
that the consists of general HELP 
texts that explain system functions 
for self-studying, and pop-up-win- 
dows for selection of available com- 
mands or objects. 

Access to the different functions of 
NATURAL ISPF is provided by 
menus or with direct commands. 
Standard functions may be as- 
signed to PF keys. The choice be- 
tween menu-driven and direct 
command input provides flexible 
and quick access to NATURAL 
ISPF's functions. 

See You in Anaheim! 

NATURAL ISPF is one of the many 
products that will be demonstrated 
at the 20th International Users' 
Conference. Also, informational 
presentations will be given on this 
product. We hope to see you at 
this demo and presentation. 



New Developments for Software AG and WANG 

Leslie Easter 
Product Manager 

Software AG announced the availa- 
bility of its core products (ADA- 
BAS, NATURAL, NATURAL 
SECURITY, PREDICT, AND SUPER- 
NATURAL) for WANG at the Inter- 
national Users' Conference last year 
in Nashville, Tennessee. At that 
time there were 2 Software AGI 
WANG customers worldwide and 
only three beta sites in the United 
States. This year, we have more 
than twenty sites throughout the 
world, with more than a quarter of 
them in the U.S.-and the number 
is rapidly growing! 

Customers all over are discovering 
what Software AG has known for 
some time: development of NATU- 
RAL applications on the WANG VS 
systems is fast, easy, efficient, and 
cost effective! And, its FUN!! This 
is the most rapidly expanding use 
for Software AG's products on the 
VS-and as more products become 
available, it will become a full de- 
velopment environment. 

For instance, NATURAL CON- 
STRUCT is currently available, 
NATURAL Architect Workstation 
is in test and PREDICT CASE is 
under conversion to the VS plat- 
form. With this product set, in 
addition to NATURAL and the VS's 
normally user-friendly environ- 
ment, development is a snap! 

Moving the applications from the 
WANG to the IBM is currently 
achieved through either an SNA 
transfer or a tape transfer. With the 
addition of NATURAL CONNEC- 
TION later this year, however, the 
applications can be moved from 
one platform to another through the 
NATURAL CONNECTION PC, in 
unattended mode, if desired. Once 
the application is ported, there is 
no need to re-stow the programs, 
maps, etc.-it's all directly com- 
patible. How much easier can it get! 

For those applications developed 
on the WANG VS which need to 
access data on the mainframe or 
another VS, NETWORK will pro- 

vide the solution, with both WSN 
(Wang Systems Networking) and 
SNA (Systems Network Architec- 
ture) support. If there is a need 
to access existing WANG applica- 
tions from NATURAL on the 
WANG, don't feel left out-with 
NATURAL DMS, NATURAL appli- 
cations on the WANG will be able 
to access any DMS or XDMS file, 
so integration is easy. 

Speaking of integration-wait until 
you see how NATURAL on the VS 
integrates with WANG's WIIS 
(Wang Integrated Imaging Systems) 
. . . Oops-out of space-you'll 
just need to visit the Software AG/ 
WANG booth at the conference to 
find out about this exciting devel- 
opment . . . See you there! 

SUPER NATURAL Serves You 

Sara Wanderer 
P r o d u ~ t  Manager 

SUPER NATURAL 2-3.1 was re- 
leased this July (1989), and this re- 
lease constitutes another step 
towards full self-service computing. 
The ability to actively manage your 
data, which was provided with 
SUPER NATURAL 2.1.1, has been 
extended with major steps toward 
decision support capabilities. 

Those of you who are involved in 
an  end user role realize that there 
are many different types of end 
users, just as there are many needs. 
One thing that you all have in com- 
mon, though, is the need to make 
decisions based upon the informa- 
tion available to you, In the process 
of making a decision, you are called 
upon to: 

a) capture the existing situation 
b] calculate budgets and plans 
c] prepare whatlif analyses 

d) justify your suggestions 
e) distribute your suggestions 
f )  monitor your results 

There are several ways, both man- 
ually and automatically, to step 
through this list. Our objective at 
Software AG is to present you with 
an integrated product set that ful- 
fills all of the requirements to help 
you make your decisions. 

SUPER NATURAL 2.3.1 is our plat- 
form that provides the support for 
your daily work. SUPER NATURAL 
allows you to create reports, proto- 
type programs and your own per- 
sonal files, without having to write 
programs. With SUPER 
NATURAL 2.3.1, the same menu- 
driven interface that allows you to 
create reports also allows you to 
perform sophisticated calculations 
using our mainframe spreadsheet, 
NATURAL SPREADSHEET, and to 
use the statistical power of the 

SAS "' System using the NATURAL 
STATISTICAL LINK. B 0th 
NATURAL SPREADSHEET and 
NATURAL STATISTICAL LINK 
will be released this fall. 

What about other applications you 
may use? The ability to create 
SUPER NATURAL applicatians 
allows you to invoke any 
NATURAL system directly. A built- 
in interface to CON-NECT, for ex- 
ample, allows you to distribute 
your SUPER NATURAL results 
electronically. You can, in turn, use 
SUPER NATURAL to help you cre- 
ate CON-NECT documents! This 
same concept will work for your 
own in-house NATURAL systems. 

You can see the interaction of all 
these components at the demo 
room at Anaheim, as well as some 
prototypes for future direction of 
the Executive Information Prod- , ucts. We hope to see you there! 



The Changing Office Environment 

Doug Wheeler 
Product Manager 

As a successful business person or 
organization much of your success 

/ I is based on your ability to respond 
to change, to communicate, and 
to effectively use existing and fu- 

I ture technology. 
The world of office systems tech- 
nology is moving forward at a tre- 
mendous pace. Seemingly, each 
week brings new announcements 
on the progress of standards, inter- 
faces, integration of graphics, 
mixed documents, optical media, 
FAX machines, voice and much 
more. The reality of the world of 
office systems is continually chang- 
ing. In fact, it is this ever-changing 
office system environment which 
represents one of the key challenges 
for Software AG's CON-NECT and 
you! 

While we have all read the books, 
heard the presentations, and at- 
tended the seminars, the words: 
"responding to change . . . improv- 
ing communication . . . effective 
use of technology . . . " will not 
bring about the competitive advan- 
tage critical to today's business 
environment. It is the explicit im- 
plementation through creative peo- 
ple using leading edge technology 
that molds these "concepts" into 
real solutions. These concepts are 
in fact the cornerstone of CON- 
NECT development. 

Responding to Change 

In order to quickly respond to the 
growing number of environments 
and technologies, CON-NECT was 
developed with an open architec- 
ture. This is demonstrated by CON- 
NECTS ability to manage ANY data 
object within the system. These 
data objects may be unlimited in  
size and may consist of textual data 
in revisable and final form, binary 
data such as: scanned images, PC 
programs and spreadsheets, system 
load modules and voice data. 

I Image Processing: 

One of the exciting new develop- 
ments for CON-NECT is image pro- 
cessing. We have developed CON- 
NECT to work with an image scan- 
ning device from IBM. CON-NECT 
provides a standard interface to 
communicate with the IBM docu- 
ment scanner 3117/3118 and can 
display the documents filed as im- 
ages on 3193 workstations. The 
image documents are stored within 
CON-NECT as special objects and 
can be merged with textual infor- 
mation which becomes part of the 
CON-NECT document. For display- 
ing the image documents, CON- 
NECT uses IBM's GDDM facilities 
for terminal communication. 

Image processing is not limited to 
the IBM environment. Using NAT- 
URAL CONNECTION for the Ma- 
cintosh, Software AG is working on 
a Macintosh front-end for the CON- 
NECT office world. In conjunction, 
the CON-NECT Macintosh interface 
will have the ability to scan images 
using the Apple scanner and dis- 
playlmodify those images at the 
workstation level. 

Another interesting project under 
investigation is the interface be- 
tween the WANG Imaging System 
and CON-NECT. Software AG is 
investigating how we can integrate 
not only WANG office, but the 
WANG Imaging System into the 
CON-NECT and NATURAL envi- 
ronment. While this capability is 
not currently demonstrable, it is 
a possible direction for CON-NECT 
and the image processing 
capability. 

By developing a flexible open archi- 
tecture, we have quickly adapted 
CON-NECT for the ever-changing 
world of image processing technol- 
ogies. In fact, the development for 
digitized "objects" can be applied 
to voice documents, desktop pub- 
lishing, and undoubtedly other 
technologies the business world has 
yet to discover. 

Improving Communication 

Within the office system environ- 
ment many communication systems 
exist which are limiting in that 
they are unable to communicate 
with each other. In some instances, 
they require specialized hardware, 

( software, and even specific operat- 
ing system environments. In fact, 
very few installations are imple- 
mented with a single integrated 
data processing and office system. 
The optimal implementation of an 
office system is one which not only 
is available to all users in all envi- 
ronments, but may include other 
users in  other office systems. For 
these reasons, CON-NECT is de- 
signed as an easily portable solu- 
tion (i.e. IBM, VAX-planned, PC 
Workstations-planned) for wherever 
the NATURAL environment ex- 
tends, and focuses on improving 
communication through CON- 
NECTivity! 

Multi-Node CON-NECT (Released): 

The communication between mul- 
tiple CON-NECT systems uses the 
Software AG general NET-WORK 
communication system which 
transparently can use multiple 
communication protocols like SNAI 
VTAM, Channel-to-Channel, VMI 
IUCV, HYPERCHANNEL, and DEC- 
NET. In this fashion, CON-NECT 
nodes may exchange all types of 
data objects and information. 

CON-NECT TELEX Support 
(Released): 

CON-NECT can directly communi- 
cate with a TELEX link for sending 
and receiving telexes by any CON- 
NECT user. CON-NECT supports 
a TELEX driver (modifiable for 
different telex systems) which al- 
lows text documents to be trans- 
mitted to a telex connection or 
received from a telex connection. 
TELEX users may be incorporated 
into the CON-NECT system and the 
communications are completely 
transparent to the user. 

CON-NECTIDISOSS Link (Under 
Development) : 

The CON-NECT DISOSS Link uses 
the API of DISOSS as an interface. 
DISOSS users may be defined in 
the CON-NECT address directory 
with full capabilities. This allows 
CON-NECT to be used within a 
DISOSS environment as a flexible 
user front-end and address direc- 
tory. The CON-NECT DISOSS Link 
is capable of communicating Revis- 
able Document Content Architec- 
ture (DCA-RFT) form documents, 
as well as Final Form Text (DCA- 
FFT). Using the translation facility 
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of CON-NECT, a DCA form docu- 
ment can be dynamically converted 
for use with the text editor within 
CON-NECT or a local word proces- 
sor. In addition, CON-NECT users 
can send documents to DISOSS 
using the DISOSS Link. 

CON-NECT SNADS Link (Under 
Development) : 

The CON-NECT SNADS Link es- 
tablishes a SNADs communication 
based on the LU 6.2 protocol. CON- 
NECT appears to the SNADS envi- 
ronment as a self-contained SNADS 
node. Thus, any system communi- 
cating via SNADS may operate with 
CON-NECT. 

Other CON-NECTivity planned or 
under development include: 

VAXMAILIALL-IN-ONE 

WANG Office 

Improving communication through 
CON-NECTivity and portability 

are key concepts that you should 
examine for a successful office 
strategy. 

It is not enough to support internal 
or external technology unless it is 
integrated in a useful fashion. 
CON-NECT effectivelv utilizes 
technology by offering you the abil- 
ity to integrate its featuresIfunctions 
into your existing applica- 
tions. As an ADABASINATURAL 
user, you have with CON-NECT a 
product which can incorporate all 
NATURAL programs into com- 
mands, menus, pf-keys, and act as 
a focal point for entry into all ap- 
plication systems. In addition, 
CON-NECT activities may be per- 
formed from outside NATURAL 
applications. Thus, objects manage- 
able within the CON-NECT system 
are also accessible to external NAT- 
URAL applications. 

By offering complete integration 
with the data processing world, 

CON-NECT offers you a means to 
incorporate technologies which 
are useful, but take on a new di- 
mension when integrated with 
daily problem solving applications. 
CON-NECT will offer you new and 
innovative ways to offer solutions 
to your users. 

I invite you to see a greatly en- 
hanced and exciting demonstration 
of CON-NECT at the Users' Confer- 
ence in Anaheim, California. We 
will be showing CON-NECT inte- 
gration with NATURAL, new image 
processing capabilities, and a pre- 
view of the CON-NECT Macintosh 
interface. In addition, we will be 
presenting our plans for CON- 
NECT'S development for the 1990's. 
1'11 look forward to seeing you 
there! 

FASTRACK: How to Jump Start Your Projects 
Pete Webster 
Custom Solutions Group 

Are you new to Software AT;% fam- 
ily of products and don't know 
where to start? Have high turnover 
rates left you with untrained staff? 
Do you have a project that you can't 
get started or that needs a burst of 
energy? 

If you answered "yes" to any or all 
of these questions, Software AG's 
Custom Solutions Group offers 
FASTRACK to help head you in the 
right direction in a hurry. 

Wha* is FASTRACK? 

FASTRACK is a custom-designed 
service that includes formal train- 
ing for you and your staff, sugges- 
tions regarding design techniques, 
proven methodology used in our 
own application development proj- 
ects, and our professionals assigned 
full-time to your site to provide 
immediate answers to your ques- 
tions and concerns. 

! 
FASTRACK provides a comprehen- 
sive work plan to educate and train 
your programmers and analysts 
using our product line. The con- 

I cept is considered "on the job" 

i training with formal education and 
I 

the practical application of the 
presented material. When your 
project is completed, your staff is 
trained and ready for departmental 
duties. One benefit of this service 
is that your application systems or 
sub-systems get written and are 
ready to use for their intended 
purpose. 

Customized to Meet Your Needs 

The key to FASTRACK is that it's 
not a "canned" set of training ob- 
jects. Our formal classes address 
the needs of your staff and recog- 
nize their current knowledge and 
experience levels. Since formal 
training is scheduled at intervals, it  
is customized according to your 
needs, timetables, and desired re- 
sults or objectives. Although the 
formal classes cover all of the fea- 
tures within Software AG's product 
line, the amount of time spent on 
different areas is directed by the 
attendees. This "participation in  
direction" has proven to be a strong 
personal motivator for all attendees 
and the FASTRACK advisor. 

I 

A secondary motivator is the "real 
life" application development that 
guides the whole project. An appli- 1 cation is designed, written, docu- 

mented, and implemented into your 
environment by your information 
systems staff. 

An important activity within 
FASTRACK is the interface with 
the user community. This provides 
an opportunity for you to cornmu- 
nicate within the company without 
the daily pressures of demands 
and problems. The objective of this 
activity is to design a system from 
your perspective, using the knowl- 
edge obtained from the education 
of FASTRACK. 

Putting FASTRACK to Work for 
Your Company 

If FASTRACK interests you, some- 
one from our Custom Solutions 
Group will analyze your require- 
ments and present a proposal for 
the work to be done, Although the 
time fox each project varies, we 
usually plan on at least eight con- 
secutive weeks, using a staff of five 
to ten data processing personnel. 
The cost of FASTRACK is set at a 
fixed price bid. There are no hidden 
costs, add-ons, or afterthoughts. 

To set FASTRACK in motion, con- 
tact your Software AG Account 
Manager today! 



PREDICT 
CASE 
contidued from page 1 

When coupled with the enforced 
use of Software Engineering prac- 
tices this approach provides the 
following benefits: 

A well documented set of User 
Requirements on which to base 
the system design. 

0 A well designed and maintaina- 
ble system with low maintenance 
costs. 

Some other typical attributes of 
this approach are not so positive: 

A long delay from recognition of 
a user need to the satisfaction 
of that need via an implemented 
system. 

0 A mismatch between the imple- 
mented system and the "docu- 
mented" requirements. For most 
systems, requirements will 
change over time. The problem 
with this approach (even with 
the use of Front End CASE tools) 
is to keep the "documented" 
requirements updated so they 
will match the implemented 
system. 

The second extreme might be 
called "Iterative Prototyping." A 
project following this approach 
spends sufficient time in require- 
ments analvsis to ensure it is "in- 
the-ballpark." Further clarification 
of user requirements is accom- 
plished through the creation and 
use of a series of "working models" 
or prototypes. The last prototype, 
with some modifications, often 
become the production system. 

The benefits of Iterative Prototyping 
are: 

It is extremely flexible, It targets 
business applications where 
either the users understanding of 
the requirements is not clear, or 
the requirements themselves 
change rapidly, 

Users tend to be more involved 
with the development effort. 
They prefer to evaluate "working 
models" rather than paper 
models. 

The time delay between identify- 
ing a need and satisfying all or 

part of that need may be much 
shorter using the second 
approach. 

Some other attributes of this ap- 
proach are also not very positive. 

The toolset used for rapid itera- 
tive prototyping may not be ap- 
propriate for a production 
system. 

It can degenerate into a "Code 
then Fix" cycle approach where 
the toolset simply allows for 
faster iterations. There is always 
the question of "When do you 
stop?" 

Systems tend to evolve instead of 
being built to a comprehensive 
design. 

Unless a shop is very disciplined, 
the only documentation for the 
system is probably the code. 

The resulting system will nor- 
mally be more expensive to 
maintain than an equivalent sys- 
tem developed with the "Water- 
fall" approach. 

What is needed is a system devel- 
opment environment that combines 
the productivity gains of a 4GL 
with the quality and productivity 
gains of front-end CASE Tools. An 
environment that combines rigorous 
analysis and documentation of re- 
quirements with a facility that can 
quickly generate a prototype based 
on those requirements. Software 
AG provides such an environment 
with its integrated CASE tool PRE- 
DICT CASE. 

PREDICT CASE supports develop- 
ment through the complete lifecycle 
from project definition to replace- 
ment of the system. It provides a 
central Development Data Base that 
serves as a repository for the logical 
and conceptual models that are 
produced during the early phases 
of a lifecycle. This Development 
Data Base is closely coupled with 
PREDICT (The Operational Data 
Base) which serves as a repository 
for the physical models created 
during the Design and Implementa- 
tion phases of a lifecycle. 

PREDICT CASE provides both a PC 
based graphic interface and an in- 
teractive Mainframe interface to 
support project definition and re- 
quirements analysis activities. Its 
workstation supports Entity Rela- 
tionship Diagrams, Decomposition 

Diagrams, and Information Analy- 
sis Diagrams. These diagrams may 
be used to initially identify objects 
(e.g., Entities, Business Functions, 
etc.) to PREDICT CASE, or objects 
already in the repository may be 
selected and downloaded to the 
Workstation. The Workstation's 
Layout Manager can be used to 
clean-up diagrams created by the 
user, or will be automatically in- 
voked to create the appropriate dia- 
gram from a set of objects when 
they are downloaded from PREDICT 
CASE. 

Quality Assurance functions are 
provided by PREDICT CASE to test 
the information stored in the Devel- 
opment Data Base. Quality Assur- 
ance occurs at three levels. 

Whenever an object is in the 
process of being identified or 
maintained interactive Quality 
Assurance checks all object spe- 
cific rules (e.g., that the name 
given to a new Entity is unique). 

Whenever an object is saved 
Quality Assurance automatically 
enforces all rules necessary to 
ensure referential integrity of the 
Development Data Base (e.g., 
That entities required by a busi- 
ness function exist in the data 
model). 

The first and second levels of QA 
ensure that the content of the 
development data base is consis- 
tent. The third level of QA 
checks a selected set of objects 
for adherence to data and process 
modeling rules. 

u 

Once the Development Data Base 
has been populated with informa- 
tion about a logical data model, a 
set of entities may be selected for 
Schema Generation. The PREDICT 
CASE Schema Generator first per- 
forms Quality Assurance on the se- 
lected set of entities, their 
relationships and attributes. Then 
guided by a set of user defined pa- 
rameters, it transforms the logical 
data model into a data base schema. 
The user may use default parame- 
ters for creating either an ADABAS 
schema or a Conceptual (SQL) 
schema, or the user can, within 
limits, modify the parameters. The 
parameters guide the Schema Gen- 
erator in everything from whether 
or not to populate PREDICT with 
the results of the schema genera- 
tion, to how to resolve a specific 
many to many relationship. 

On the process side, methodology 
and tool support is provided for the 



identification and specification of 
System Functions, Business Func- 
tions describe the full set of logical 
user requirements. System Func- 
tions describe the operations that 
will be performed by an automated 
system in order to support the 
Business Functions. When a Sys- 
tem Function is defined it then 
becomes a candidate for the Pro- 
gram Composer. 

The PREDICT CASE Program Com- 
poser provides a facility for the 
identification and association of 
reusable blocks of code. It associ- 
ates various object types (e.g., 
Maps, Standard Procedures, Cus- 
tom Components, etc.) with Frames 
that are specific to a System Func- 
tion Type. A System Function is 
first identified as a specific System 
Function Type. This triggers the 
association with a Frame that pulls 
in  all associated blocks of code. 
The only new code that the user 
must write is application or pro- 
gram specific logic and algorithms. 

Software AG provides a range of 
solutions in its NATURAL ENGI- 
NEERING SERIES to address prob- 
lems in the Application Develop- 
ment Environment. PREDICT CASE 
is targeted to support the complete 
development environment: 

At the Information Systems Man- 
agement Level with Strategic 
Planning, Information Systems 
Planning, and a repository to 
store, utilize, and control Corpo- 
rate Data and Process Models, 

At the project management level 
with lifecycle models and project 
reporting (Document Generation), 
and, 

At the staff level within a project 
with front-end CASE tools 
merged with Schema Generation 
and the Program Composer all 
targeting a highly productive 
4GL (NATURAL). 

Other solutions provided by Soft- 
ware AG include NATURAL Archi- 
tect Workstation and NATURAL 
CONSTRUCT. These products pro- 
vide a staff level solution that ad- 
dresses the need for immediate 
productivity gains both for new 
development and for re-engineering 
of existing systems. 

During the Users' Conference there 
will be many opportunities to learn 
more about PREDICT CASE. A se- 
ries of detailed demonstrations 
of PREDICT CASE, its Workstation, 

the Schema Generator, and the Pro- 
gram Composer will be provided 
in the demonstration facility. In ad- 
dition the following presentations 
on CASE, the NATURAL ENGI- 
NEERING SERIES, and PREDICT 
CASE will be given during the con- 
ference. (NOTE: Check the Confer- 
ence Catalog for complete 
descriptions of these 
presentations.) 

CASE and Quality Improvement 
by Vaughan Merlyn 

(In Executive Track) 

NATURAL Engineering Series: 
SAG CASE Strategy for the 90s. 

PREDICT CASE: Repository Drive 
Tool Support for Application 
Software Development 

(A conceptual view of PRE- 
DICT CASE) 

I-CASE: Methodology and Tool 
Support for the full Lifecycle 

(A technical view of PREDICT 
CASE) 

* Developing Applications Using 
PREDICT CASE 

(User Presentation) 

Building applications Using ISO- 
TEC, the Methodology of PRE- 
DICT CASE 

(Class by SAGNA Education) 

CASE Application Development 
(Application Workshop by 

SAGNA Custom Solutions) 

VMS 
continued from page 3 

. . . And in-depth discussions of 
how to further apply Software AG 
VAX technology: 

Installing and Maintaining Soft- 
ware AG VMS Software 

Software AG Network Strategy 

Database Backup & Recovery 

Trouble-shooting in the ADABAS 
and NATURAL Environment 

Performance & Tuning; Capacity 
Planning 

Maintaining Integrity in Multi- 
node Networks 

And you'll see keynote presenta- 
tions-again, exclusively for our 
VAX customers-by Software AG 
executives, Digital representatives, 

expert industry analysts, and Soft- 
ware AG's Digital product devel- 
opers. Additionally, we'll be 
presenting new information-and 

1 hands-on demonstrations-of im- 
portant, new technologies of iiitsr- 
est to all Digital users: 

NATURAL Rdb 

NATURAL RMS 

ADABAS 2 

NATURAL 2 

See You in Anaheim! 

In short, we're offering a program 
. for our VAX customers like never 

before. Your attendance at Anaheim 
will bring you up to date on all of 
our latest advances and future 
plans, and provides a unique op- 
portunity to share questions and 
answers with hundreds of other 
users. 

And, needless to say, you'll be 
again enjoying one of the finest 
Users' Conferences in the world- 
complete with our typically out- 
standing social events, and the un- 
paralleled regional attractions 
offered by the Anaheim area. 

So make your plans to attend 
"Windows on Tomorrow" . . . see 
your Users' Conference registration 
kit for more information. And we'll 
plan on seeing you there! 

/ STOP! \ 
If you haven't 
registered for 

Software AG's 20th 
International Users' 

Conference 
Call Now! 

1-800-843-9534 



Graphic Information Systems: 
What Are They? Why Are They Important? I 
Bill Gordon 
Geographic Information Systems 

Recently, Software AG announced 
its plans for development of two 
new products that are designed to 
support applications in  an area 
called Geographic Information Sys- 
tems, or GIs. The new products, 
ADABAS Geographic and 
NATURAL Geographic Worksta- 
tion, are used in conjunction with 
a digital map data base of the street 
network, for any given area, and 
provide end users with the ability 
to manipulate and view data from a 
geographic perspective. 

Why are these products and appli- 
cations considered important? 
What value and benefit do GIs ap- 
plications provide to the end user? 

Some History 

Geography and the use of geo- 
graphic data have been with us in 
many parts of our business opera- 
tions for a very long time. Paper 
map systems reflect this phenome- 
non and have been manually cre- 
ated and maintained to support a 
wide range of industry applications 
for many years. 

As computer technologies have 
evolved, they have been applied to 
geographic data processing by car- 
tographers and engineers who 
wanted to "automate" many of the 
very labor-intense steps that go into 
creating and maintaining numerous 
map products and mapping appli- 
cations. Many improvements and 
advances in computerization of 
these activities have been devel- 
oped over the last 20 years. In fact, 
the evolution of these technical 
products, and increased recogni- 
tion of the value of geographically 
related data, have stimulated such 
significant interest in commercial 
industries and government that 
entirely new segments of business 
applications and categories of data 
processing products have surfaced 
in the last ten years. 

In the original efforts to automate 
geographic data processing, the 
emphasis was very much on man- 
aging the geography itself. Applica- 5 tions for land use ~ l a n n i n a  and 

environmental research were the 
targets of the early technology be- 
cause that was the essence of what 
the paper map really was for the 
end user-an image of the surface 
of the earth, 

As technology was applied to the 
problem of managing geographic 
data, it became apparent that there 
was an equally important charac- 
teristic in the mar, svstems of the 
end user that needeh to be ad- 
dressed. The end product, the map 
itself, typically reflected many im- 
portant elements of business infor- 
mation. In fact, the map was the 
only mechanism for showing the 
nhvsical distribution of critical 
business data [see Figure 11, such 
as where customers are, where crit- 
ical business data is. where facili- 
ties are, and where service calls 
occur most frequently. 

CIS Enters the Picture 

It was becoming apparent that ge- 
ography, or at least geographic pa- 
rameters, played a critical role in 
the actual organization of the busi- 
ness enterprise and its operations. 
How would a business organization 
function if it could not geographi- 
cally segment its market, define its 
distribution channels, regionalize 
its sales, or describe the boundaries 
of its service areas? Further, how 
effective could one be in organizing 
business operations without the 
ability to identify what the basic 
distribution of business data was in 
relation to the other components 
of the organization (see Figure 2). 

Imagine a sales manager defining a 
target market without understand- 
ing the location and characteristics 
of the consumer. How would the 
distribution manager organize the 
placement of product outlets or 
distribution centers without know- 
ing the patterns of buying activity 
or density of product sales? And, 
finally, how would the municipal 
government realign boundaries for 
reapportionment without under- 
standing the geographic distribu- 
tion of data such as property 
values, demographics, and other 
socioeconon~ic information? Man- 
aging the geographically distrib- 

uted information of the business 
enterprise was clearly an important 
capability. 

Developments in automated map- 
ping and geographic data manage- 
ment projects soon pointed out 
the importance of effectively man- 
aging and integrating data that was 
related to geography, or "geographi- 
cally distributed." Because geog- 
raphy or physical location provided 
a common denominator for the 
association of business data, it 
could be used as the basis for a 
powerful new information system 
architecture. Many new applica- 
tions could be constructed that 
would merge and analyze business 
data from the common view of 
geography-a geographic informa- 
tion system. 

GIs Technology 
Many types of products and appli- 
cations have come into the market- 
place over the last 10 to 15 years 
that have tried to satisfy the geo- 
graphic data processing require- 
ments of the end user. The majority 
of them have emphasized the 
graphics processing capabilities 
typically associated with auto- 
mated mapping systems. While 
these have improved the manufac- 
ture and look of the mapping prod- 
ucts themselves, they have done 
little to address the management of 
the geographically related data that 
already resides in the end user's 
data processing systems. Most GIs 
implementations become "depart- 
mental" systems, or standalone 
workstations, that have no direct 
access to the wealth of data in the 
product systems of a corporation. 
If corporate data is to be used in 
the GIs, cumbersome and costly 
conversion procedures must be 
implemented to extract information 
and apply it to the GIs application. 
The typical GIs installation cannot 
be integrated into the existing data 
processing environment of the 
business enterprise. Therefore, the 
most significant benefits of install- 
ing a geographic data base-corpo- 
rate data integration-are not 
realized. The GIs departmental 
systems and graphics workstations 
become "islands of automation." 

continued on page 14 
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Figure 1: Geography in the Organization 



COMMON COMMERCIAL ACTIVITY 

CONSUMER CONTACT 
CUSTOMER ORDER 
PRODUCT ASSEMBLY 
PRODUCT DISPATCH 
PHYSICAL DELIVERY 
CUSTOMER SERVICES 

PROMOTION 
SALES 
MANUFACTURING 
DISTRIBUTION 
SERVICE 

OPERATIONS 
ORGANIZATION 
RESEARCH 
PLANNING 

Figure 2: Generic Business Applications that Reference Geography 



GEOGRAPHIC DATA GANAGEMENT 
FOR CORPORATE APPLICATIONS 7 

ADABAS GEOGRAPHIC 

CORPORATE 
MAINFRAME 

SYSTEMS 

, 
Session NATURAL 

CONNECT~ON TRANS-PASS VM-PASS MULTI-PASS NET-PASS Management 

NET-WORK 
Connectivity 

Data 
Comrnunlcation 

Common 
Application 
Solutions 

Application 
Development 

Dictionary 

Distributed 
Data - - - - - - - 
Data Base 

NET-WORK 

SNA VTAM 
HYPER- SNA- CTC IUCV DCAM DECNET CHANNEL G ~ ~ ~ ~ A Y  LU2.1 LU6.1 

' . COM-PLETE ClCS CMSIDC TSO CMS UTM 

SUPER NATURAL NATURAL 
DOCUMENT CON-NECT ' ' . -NATURAL OPERATIONS 

MANAGEMENT 

NATURAL N'AT RAL 
GRAPHICS ELKE. GEOPROCESSING APPLICATIONS 

COBOLIPLI NATURAL 

PREDICT CASE NATURAL EXPERT 

I PREDICT ' - .  

- , .. .... .... , I 

SOFTWARE AG ISA 

Figure 3: Geographic Data Management for Corporate Applications 



continued from page 10 

The Key to GIs 
In recent years, the most significant 
innovation has been the recognition 
that "geography" is already a part 
of business applications. It is not 
a totally new set of data that must 
be created and managed as an au- 
tomated graphics product replacing 
all paper map systems of the enter- 
prise. In fact, the most important 
consideration in building a GIs ar- 
chitecture for corporate applica- 
tions is to introduce geographic 
data management tools that operate 
against the street address that cur- 
rently resides in the business sys- 
tem data base. This address-based 
data is the geography of the com- 
mercial business application and 
the government agency. It is the key 
common denominator that relates 
most geographically distributed in- 
formation for critical business 
operations. 

ADABAS Geographic and 
NATURAL Geographic 
Workstation 
These components in the Integrated 
Software Architecture of 
Software AG--ADABAS 
Geographic and NATURAL Geo- 
graphic Workstation-manage the 
geography of a corporation as an 
integrated data base. They support 
the general retrieval and manipula- 
tion of geographic elements, and 
allow application system programs 
to access geographically distributed 
information just as they do any 
other form of data. 

These facilities provide the corpo- 
ration with a tremendously power- 
ful tool for improved data 
management in a variety of appli- 
cation areas. The corporate end 
user can now manage information 
that is geographically distributed 
(see Figure 3). In fact, the all-im- 
portant characteristics of the distri- 
bution itself can be analvzed and 
correlated with other fictors in 
business operations. Most signifi- 
cantly, the geographic common 
denominator concept implemented 
in this way provides the basis for 
overall data integration for the 
enterprise. 

Who Benefits? 
A wide range of industry opera- 

14 
tions can be significantly improved 

with the introduction of a cost- 
effective geographic data manage- ' ment system. Government agencies, 
at both the state and local levels, 
have extensive amounts of 
geographically distributed data that 
they must manage effectively. 

I For many commercial operations, 
such as those listed below, effective 
geographic data management appli- 

1 cations are critical to overall profit- 
I ability in the enterprise: 

Utilities 
Newspapers 
Package and postal delivery 

services 
Rail and truck transportation 
Real estate 
Travel services 
Health and emergency services 
Marketing research 

Next Quarter 

In the next issue of Connections, 
look for examples of geographic 
data management applications us- 
ing ADABAS Geographic and 
NATURAL Geographic 
Workstation. 

Users' 
Conference 
continued from page 1 

A Typical Day 

General Sessions will take place 
every morning then you can attend 
1 of 10 breakout sessions running 
concurrently! Since you can't be in 
10 places at once we suggest send- 
ing more then one representative 
from your organization. Sessions 
will include: 

User Presentations: Users relate 
the application of Software AG 
technologies in various environ- 
ments, to meet various 
challenges; 

Workshops: Users lead informal 
sessions on specific Software AG 
products, as defined by each 
Special Interest Group (SIG); 

Software AG Presentations: led 
by Software AG executives and 
product managers, these sessions 
give you detailed status informa- 
tion about the products you 
use-including their future di- 
rections; and 

0 Classes: Technical experts from 
Software AG's worldwide offices 
conduct in-depth, interactive 
classes to further expand your 
technical knowledge and skills. 

Executive Track Conference: third 
consecutive year 

This year's program, designed ex- 
clusively for executives, is full of 
up-to-date information on the latest 
trends in the information systems 
industry, 

We'll have industry analysts such 
as Vaughan Merlyn, Paul Hessinger, 
and John Logan speaking on the 
latest industry trends so you know 
how to position your company for 
the 1990's. Business Management 
speakers: Dr. James Wetherbe, 
Nancy Austin, and Peter Johnson 
will share their expertise in the 
areas of information svstems, lead- 
ership, and strategic positioning. 

Also, Software AG Executives will 
talk about future plans for the 
1990's and how Software AG is 
"The Better Ghoice.'Trofessm Pe- 
ter Chen, "father"0f the Entity- 
Relationship approach to database 
design, and Peter Page', Executive 
Vice President, Software AG, will 
discuss "Where CASE Meets 
DBMS ." 
Software AG customers from the 
University of Texas and Central 
Hudson Gas & Electric will present 
on how they used Software AG 
products to produce state-of-the-art 
results. 

The Executive Track Conference 
will be held on October 22-24, 
1989 at the Anaheim Hilton con- 
current with the 20th International 
Users' Conference. 

See You in Anaheim! 

If you haven't registered for the 
20th International Users' Confer- 
ence call 1-800-843-9534 and ask 
for the Users' Conference Registrar! 
You won't want to miss getting a 
first-hand glimpse of the new di- 
rections and technologies that will 
provide the solutions you'll need in 
the next 20 years! And at no other 
time will there be this many Soft- 
ware AG users convened together to 
share their experiences! So come 
to Anaheim, help us celebrate Soft- 
ware ACs 20th Anniversary which 
you have made possible, and take 
a look at the future of information 
management through our "Win- 
dows on Tomorrow." 



PREDICT USER PANEL MEETING 

Patti Piccola 
BP Exploration 
Administrative Product Representative 

Editor's Note: In the Summer issue of 
Connections the 1988 PREDICT User 
Panel Meeting notes were published. I 
apologize for any confusion this 
caused. Below is a summary of the 
most recent meeting 

The 1989 PREDICT User Panel was 
held in Reston, Virginia on June 
22 ,  with sixteen panel members 
present. Panel members contributed 
specific questions, concerns and 
issues to be discussed with Chris 
Hopker, Software AG Darmstadt, 
Manager of PREDICT Development. 
Also in attendance from Software 
AG were Randy Kastendieck, 
SAGNA, Customer Support, and 
Virginia Sullivan, PREDICT QA 
Analyst. 

As many of you know, Software AG 
has been working for a long time 
on a project that was originally 
called Version 3.0, which was 
based on ADABAS native. Software 
AG stated that PREDICT Version 
3.0 will not be the same product 
which had been previously an- 
nounced. Software AG has refo- 
cused their direction on the data 
dictionary after extensive analysis 
and discussion in Darmstadt. The 
previous Version 3.0 has been re- 
named Version 4.0. This change in 
product structure was brought 
about by advances in Software AG's 
Entity Relationship modeling soft- 
ware-ADABAS Entire. PREDICT 
V4.0 will be based on ADABAS 
Entire. PREDICT CASE has demon- 
strated that ADABAS Entire gives 
the performance and functionality 

required for a Computer Aided 
Software Engineering (CASE) data 
dictionary environment. 

There will still be a Version 3, now 
called Version 3.1.0. This version 
was orginally PREDICT Version 2.4. 
Are you lost yet? The renaming of 
version numbers is a bit confusing; 
but, I will try to clarify and identify 
which version is providing what 
functionality. 

First, listed is the current status of 
PREDICT: 

PREDICT Version 2.3.2 

Current (as of July 15, 1989) 

PREDICT Version 2.3.3 

continued on page 21 

Japan Region 
Users' Group 
16th General 
Meeting Held 
Sadayuki Takehana 
Nikon, Co. Ltd. 

On June 7, 1989, the 16th General 
Meeting of Japan Region Software 
AG Users' Group was held in  Tokyo 
with 232 attendants from 161 orga- 
nizations (including 84 organiza- 
tions attending as attorneys). 

The meeting consisted of the report 
of activities for the previous year, 
the announcement of this year's 
activity plans and the awarding for 
excellent activities. There was 
much enthusiasm for this year's 
activity 

Mr. Michael Jakes, Senior Vice 
President of International Opera- 
tions Software AG of North Amer- 
ica had visited again and reported 
the current status of Software AG 
Group around the world. 

Report of ActivitiesIActivity Plans 
far '89 

In addition to the regular agenda 
(report on closing accounts, activi- 
ties of each study group and its 
activity plans for '89 as well as ap- 
proval of the board of Users' 
Group), there was a report on the 
new committee which was orga- 
nized in order to reconsider Users' 
Group activities. 

5 Study Groups (Database Study 
Group; Network Study Group; 
Computer Operation Study Group; 
Cross Over Study Group; inter- 
changing opinions of various prod- 
ucts; Management Study Group, 
aiming at people at the manage- 
ment level) will work on their 
themes this year. The former three 
study groups are further divided 
into 24 sessions and meet once a 
month. Each group will report its 
study results at the next users' 
symposium to be held in March 
1990. 

Also, it was reported that "Users' 
Group Newsletter" played an im- 

portant role in  activating commu- 
nication among users. 

Awarding Excellent Activities 

The "Excellent Activity Award" 
established last year was given. In- 
dividuals and groups that have 
achieved excellent results in  the 
previous year are elected and 
awarded. 

This year the awards were given to 
one person in the case study sec- 
tion and to four groups in the group 
study section. 

Management Study Group 

After the General Meeting, Manage- 
ment Study Group held a meeting 
in whch  82 people from 70 organi- 
zations attended. 

Mr. Masayuki Kamei of Toyota Au- 
tomatic Loom Works, Ltd. made a 
speech on "Quality Assurance of 
Software through Systematic Devel- 
opment" at the meeting. 



First VMS SIG Conference Smash Success 

Michael Livingston 
VMS SIG Chairman 

"My head is about to explode, I 
never knew there was so much to 
learn!" "One day here is worth 
more than reading all the manuals 
in the world!" "It's almost unima- 
ginable that I could learn so much 
and have so much fun doing it! My 
thanks to all the folks at The Uni- 
versity of Houston for making it all 
possible." "The things I've learned 
here I've never seen in any man- 
ual-it's great having the devel- 
opers teaching these classes!" "The 
folks in Houston sure know how 
to make you welcome and keep you 
well fed!" These were but a few of 
the many comments from several of 
the many attendees of the First 
Annual Software AG VMS SIG 
Users' Conference. 

The VMS conference was held from 
March 1 2  through March 15, 1989 
and was hosted by the University of 
Houston in  Houston, Texas at the 
luxurious Stouffer's Hotel. The 
conference was attended by over 
200 people from twelve countries. 

The theme of the VAX conference 
was internals and featured Dr. Her- 
bert Fischer and Peter Holdermann 
both of Software AG, Darmstadt, 
West Germany, who over the course 
of three days presented well over 
fifteen hours of formal classes on 
NATURAL, ADABAS, and NET- 
WORK VMS. Among the topics 
covered were: 

"ADABAS Intertask 
Communication" 

"NATURAL Internals: Data 
Structures, Code Generation, 
Processing Flow, Optimization, 
and Parameters" 

a "ADABAS Internal Structures" 

a "ADABAS I10 Routines" 

"NETWORK VMS: Protocol Han- 
dler and Network Manager" 

In addition to the presentations 
made by Dr. Fischer and Mr. Hold- 
ermann, several user and 
Software AG presentations were 
also made. These presentations 
included: 

"Command Log Interpretation" 
by Bruce Sions, Department of 
Transportation, State of Virginia 

"Customizing the User Environ- 
ment" by Melinda Irwin and 
Suresh Kumar, University of 
Houston 

"Writing DCL Command Proce- 
dures" by John Fredrickson, Na- 
tional Public Radio 

"NATURAL Architect" by Andy 
Coutts, Software AG, Canada 

"High Available Systems" by 
Ron Kaminski, Inland Steel 

"Command Analysis: A Practical 
Tool" by Tom McNeally, CNCP 

"Product Overview and Future 
Directions" by Mary Kirkman, 
Software AG, North America 

"NATURAL Programming Tips 
and Techniques" by Melinda 
Irwin, University of Houston 

The conference was officially 
opened by Michael Livingston who 
welcomed the attendees to Hous- 
ton. Michael then introduced Tom 
Berrisford, Director of Administra- 
tive Computing, University of 
Houston. Tom gave an overview of 
the mission of the University of 
Houston as well as a slide presenta- 
tion on the University of Houston 
campus. Tom then introduced Dr. 
Richard Van Horn, President, Uni- 
versity of Houston. Dr. Van Horn 
gave a presentation on the advent of 
computerization and its impact on 
modern information processing. 
Tom Berrisford then introduced 
John Maguire, Chairman of the 
Board, Software AG of North 
America. 

John enthusiastically welcomed the 
attendees to the conference and 
noted how the gathering was simi- 
lar to the founding of SAGGROUP, 
the users group. John also noted 
that the formation of a VAX Special 
Interest Group and promotion of a 
conference was long over due  and 
was greatly welcomed by Software 
AG. John spent several minutes 
explaining the reasons behind the 
merger of Software AG, North 
America with Software AG, Darms- 
tadt. In summary, John believed 

that the merger would result i n  a 
much stronger Software AG. John 
then opened the floor to general 
questions from the audience. In 
closing, John pledged 
Software AG's continued support 
to the VAX SIG. 

During the conference considerable 
discussion was given for a method 
to easily distribute "shareware" 
from users and information in  gen- 
eral. John Fredrickson and Tom 
McNeally donated tapes of DBA 
tools to the SIG. Dan Nolan, of No- 
lan and Associates, graciously of- 
fered use of his VAX system as a 
messaging and software download 
facility. The number to dial to take 
advantage of free user software is 
(703) 642-1111. The account num- 
ber and password is "VMSSIG". 
Dan Nolan and Associates, 
Software AG, the software authors, 
nor members of the VMS SIG take 
any responsibility i n  the function- 
ing or maintenance of any "share- 
ware" software. 

Conference attendees were treated 
to sumptuous meals at the Stouf- 
fer's Hotel with the feature event 
being a night out at the Texas Tum- 
bleweed, a favorite Texas dinner 
place for T-Bone steak cooked only 
the way Texans can cook. In addi- 
tion to the filling dinner, the atten- 
dees were delighted by a popular 
country-western band and dancers 
dressed in authentic country-west- 
ern dancewear. 

At the close of the conference the 
attendees unanimously elected the 
University of Houston to host the 
second conference once again in 
Houston. One attendee said "I don't 
know how Michael and the folks 
in Houston can possibly out do 
themselves next year but I'm going 
to be here again to watch them 
try!" 

So, stay tuned for further informa- 
tion on the next VMS SIG 
Conference. 



Onward To 
Anaheim! 
Michael Livingston 
VMS SIG Chairman 

The 20th International Software AG 
Users' Conference is upon us and 
I hope that every Software AG user 
will be there, especially the VMS 
users! 

VMS users are like all users; they 
want to know "What's in it for 
me?" The Users' Conference repre- 
sents a rare once a year educational 
opportunity for all Software AG 
users to meet under one roof to 
hear and discuss what has tran- 
spired in  Software AG and user 
shops throughout the world since 
the last conference. At the confer- 
ence you have the opportunity to 
not only learn from one another but 
from Software AG developers who 
you may never have the occasion to 
meet otherwise. 

This year, Software AG has dedi- 
cated great time and energy to in- 
suring that an informative agenda 
is prepared for VMS users in addi- 
tion to the usual superb general 
sessions. So it is with great enthu- 
siasm that I encourage all the VMS 
users to join me in Anaheim in 
October. 

VMS SIG Agenda 
Michael Livingston 
VMS SIG Chairman 

A general meeting of the VAX VMS 
Special Interest Group will be held 
during the 20th International 
Software AG Users' Conference. 
Agenda items will include: 

Report on the First VMS Users' 
Conference in Houston, Texas 

Request for Topics for Second 
VMS Users' Conference 

Discussion of ChangelEnhance- 
ment issues 

Other topics as suggested by 
attendees 

We hope to see you there! 

Wanted: User 
Support 
Michael Livingston 
VMS SIG Chairman 

The one thing that is common 
among users is complaints! It 
doesn't matter how hard and long 
we work on a project the final re- 
sults always fall short of their ex- 
pectations and needs. No doubt 
each of us can give pause and re- 
count numerous times we've said 
to our own users, "Well, if you had 
just told me that, I wouldn't have 
done it that way in the first place!" 
or "If you knew that was a prob- 
lem, why didn't you tell me?" 

In the great scheme of things, we 
are all users to Software AG. I've 
heard many accounts in the past 
two years of how Software AG 
". . . doesn't understand my prob- 
lem . . ." or "If only Software AG 
would make this change it would 
make my life so much easier . . ." 
When I've asked if anyone at the 
site has filled out a Changel 
Enhancement form, I either get a 
blank stare or a reply of "What's 
that?" 

Completion of the Changel 
Enhancement form is an essential 
procedure for anv user to commu- 
kca te  product deficiencies and 
future product desires to 
Software AG. The way the process 
works is as follows: ChangelEn- 
hancement forms are available in 
the back pages of each copy of 
Software AG's CONNECTIONS. 
Anyone from a licensed site may 
fill out a form. Once completed the 
forms should be returned to the 
address indicated on the reverse 
side of the form. Currently, the 
forms are returned to Kelly Jones of 
Leaseway National Service Corpo- 
ration, 3700 Park East Drive, 
Beachwood, OH 44122. Upon re- 
ceipt of your form, Kelly catego- 
rizes the forms by product and 
nature of the request. Kelly also 
attempts to categorize the requests 
as "product generic" or "product 
specific", i.e. is the request generic 
to all NATURAL users or is it spe- 
cific to VAX users. Once Kelly has 
categorized the requests, they are 
sent to Software AG in  Reston, 
Virginia where ultimately it is sent 
to the product developers. 

Unfortunately, very few VMS user 
sites participate in the process. 
Various reasons are given for non- 
action. In particular, I've heard 
many VMS users either say 
"What's the use of filling out a 
change form; nobody in 
Software AG takes them seriously" 
or "What's the use of filling i t  out; 
the IBM users outnumber us and 
they always get their way!" 

Contrary to the above statements, 
ChangeIEnhancement forms are im- 
portant. First of all, Software AG 
takes the forms very seriously since 
the forms are the only means by 
which Software AG has the oppor- 
tunity to communicate with every 
Software AG user world-wide. The 
ChangelEnhancement forms are 
read carefully by Software AG rep- 
resentatives in Reston, Virginia, 
and by representatives in Darm- 
stadt, West Germany (including the 
product developers!). 

Second, while it is true that there 
are more IBM licences held world- 
wide than VMS licenses this is 
changing rapidly. In addition, SAG- 
GROUP representatives do make 
an effort to determine which re- 
quests are specific to the VAX envi- 
ronment and to see that those 
requests are reported to 
Software AG as specific concerns. 

Most important, however, is not the 
procedure and process; it is par- 
ticipation! VMS users will have 
less of an impact upon the overall 
product direction of Software AG 
unless they actively voice their 
concerns and desires at every op- 
portunity. The ChangelEnhance- 
ment form represents a basic input 
to Software AG and is meaningless 
unless com~leted and returned to 
them. 

The ChangelEnhancement process 
is by no means perfect. Unfortu- 
nately improvements to products or 
to the user feedback structure can- 
not be implemented until every 
VMS user sends in his or her form 

1 and takes the responsibility for 
being involved! 



Communications 
Functional Area 
Representative 
Report 

Ellen M. Birch 
Price Waterhouse 

Note: This report was scheduled to 
appear in the Summer 1989 
Issue of Connections. By 
mistake it was accidently 
omitted. 

The editor apologizes for any 
inconvenience this has 
caused. 

Thanks to so many of you for keep- 
ing in touch and passing on your 
concerns, problems, and ideas. I've 
had some very interesting discus- 
sions since my last newsletter arti- 
cle and I have summarized some 
of these below: 

8 COM-PLETE support of ADABAS 
Version 5 user exits A and B- 
Currently, the ULOPADAB exit 
does not support this interface. I 
have been informed by SAG that 
this will be supported in release 
4.5 of COM-PLETE. 

8 COM-PLETE compatibility with 
Candle's Suppersession session 
manager-There have been re- 
ported hangs in COM-PLETE 
when used with this product. 
These hangs can be corrected 
through a change to the VTAM 
logmode table entry for the hang- 
ing device. 

8 COM-PLETE 4.4.3-This SM has 
been released as of the date of 
this article-no feedback yet. 

8 COM-PLETE 4.5-In my last ar- 
ticle, I stated that this release 
was in beta test. As expected, 
the dates on this release have 
slipped, with it currently still in 
alpha test, with no earlier than 
an early summer release ex- 
pected. Those of us with multi- 
engine processors could defi- 
nitely use the multi-processor 5 support this release will provide. 
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8 SYSCOMISYSNAT model user- 
ids-The concept of having one 
COM-PLETE userid record in 
the userid file used for multiple 
concurrently logged on users was 
introduced with 4.4, but not 
documented until the SM3 re- 
lease notes. This is an excellent 
idea for integration with RACFI 
ACFZiTop Secret userids-be 
sure to read about it in the re- 
lease notes. 

8 UZAPS-This is an extremely 
useful utility that will list all ap- 
plied COM-PLETE fixes and all 
available and applied apply- 
mods. In my opinion, this utility 
is not as well known or empha- 
sized as it should be. 

8 HSM support-The UXEEX5 
user exit will allow, in UPDS or 
UEDIT, issuing of the recall SVC 
for a library that has been mi- 
grated by IBM's Hierarchical 
Storage Manager. 

8 External security interface docu- 
mentation-This is minimal to 
nonexistent in the regular man- 
uals, with just a brief explana- 
tion in the SM3 release notes. 
SAG needs to provide more thor- 
ough documentation in this area, 
including a more detailed de- 
scription of the format and use 
of the RACTAB for 8 to 6 charac- 
ter userid conversion. 

8 COM-PLETE's use of the SVC 
FLIH-It was brought to my at- 
tention that numerous questions 
and comments about the method 
COM-PLETE uses to process 
and trap SVCs were put on the 
Bitnet "IBM Mainframe Discus- 
sion List" bulletin board. Much 
incorrect and out-of-date infor- 
mation was sent around on this 
bulletin board about how 
COM-PLETE functions and how 
it integrates with the operating 
system and other systems soft- 
ware. If you have questions about 
COM-PLETE logic, please direct 
them to me first-I may have 
the answer, or can get an answer 
for you. 

The following questions have been 
brought to my attention and are 
still outstanding. Please call me if 
you are interested i n  these issues 
or if you have a solution: 

8 Natural Program thread prior- 
ity-I'm still looking for ideas on 
how to provide COM-PLETE 
thread-locking for a program 

running under NATURAL, not 
just for the NATURAL system 
itself. 

8 KOMAND-I'm looking for expe- 
riences in using this billing 
product in a COM-PLETE 
environment. 

8 SMP-Has anyone implemented 
their own method of COM-PLETE 
maintenance through SMP? Soft- 
ware AG will be providing this 
in the future, but there may be 
people who have gone ahead 
with their own system. 

Please contact me if you have con- 
cerns or information to pass on 
to Software AG or other users or if 
you're looking for other users with 
similar problems or environments. 
Since the next Executive Commit- 
tee meeting is on May 10, I am even 
more interested in your issues to 
present at that meeting. Keep in 
mind that the changeienhancement 
process is your best bet to get your 
ideas to Software AG on the direc- 
tion of the communications prod- 
ucts. I still haven't seen any of 
these in some time! 

I want to especially thank Don 
Castleberry of Delta Air Lines for 
the following article on assigning 
default printers to users without 
using TIBTAB. I am always happy 
to receive articles for the newslet- 
ter. If you have done anything inter- 
esting with any of the communica- 
tions products, just jot down some 
thoughts and send or fax them to 
me-I'll take care of editing them 
for the newsletter. My fax number 
is (301) 493-9161. 

I am still looking for a volunteer to 
chair the COM-PLETE Futures User 
Panel at this year's conference. 
Please contact me if you are inter- 
ested. The purpose of this panel 
is to keep the lines of communica- 
tion open between COM-PLETE 
developers and users-a very wor- 
thy cause. 

As always, I look forward to hearing 
from all of you. 



UPDATE: 
Communications 
Functional Area 
Representative 

Ellen M. Birch 
Price Waterhouse 

Since my last article, the 
SAGGROUP Executive Committee 
midyear meeting was held at the 
Software AG Denver Offices on May 
10 through 12. I would like to share 
with you some of the items related 
to the communications area: 

0 The communications area is now 
defined to include COMPLETE, 
ADABAS TPF, ADABAS HPE, 
ACCESS, NET-PASS, VM-PASS, 
TRANS-PASS, NATURAL AF, 
and all NET-WORK products. 

Incompatibility of the different 
Software AG products was a big 
topic of discussion (e.g., what 
release of COM-PLETE do you 
need to support NATURAL 
2.1.4?). Ability of Software AG to 
fix problems with all supported 
releases across products was also 
an issue. Software AG will be 
pursuing avenues of addressing 
these problems. 

The multiple iterations of the 
COM-PLETE 4.4.2 tape was also 
an  issue. In the future, Software 
AG will address this with fix 
tapes between SMs, labelled 
with the latest fix number. 

I am also chairing a committee 
within the Executive Committee 
that is studying issues related to 
world-wide sharing of information 
among Software AG users-includ- 
ing,'but not limited to, use of Ser- 
vice Connection as a vehicle for 
this .  Sample issues include lan- 
guage translations and distribution 
of papers and documents. If you 
have any ideas related to this topic, 
please contact me. 

Thanks again to those of you who 
have been keeping in  touch and 
passing on your concerns, prob- 
lems, and ideas. Some of the issues 
raised since my last newsletter 
article have been: 

STOW macro support for COM- 
PLETE under ESA-The STOW 
macro is being changed to sup- 
port this environment. As of this 
writing, the fix is still in beta 

test. Be aware that this fix will 
change the functionality of the 
STOW macro. I would be inter- 
ested in hearing of your experi- 
ences with and opinions on this 
change. 

COM-PLETE 4.4.3-This SM has 
not been as clean as one would 
hope. Software AG is aware of 
these problems and is working to 
correct this situation. 

COM-PLETE 4.5-As of this 
writing, this version has not been 
released. Look for it around the 
end of the year. 

COM-PLETE's (and ADABAS 
TPF) use of the SVC FLIH- 
There is a project to eliminate 
use of this mechanism, as part of 
the effort to use IBM standard 
interfaces in  COM-PLETE. This 
will be included in Version 4.5. 

IBM-to-DEC NET-WORK compat- 
ibility-There are discussions 
currently proceeding on issues 
with compatibility of ADABAS 5 
on the IBM side, NET-WORK, 
and ADABAS on the VAX side 
(e.g., what releases of NET- 
WORK and VAX ADABAS are 
required, what steps should be 
taken in any conversions or inte- 
grations). If you are interested 
in this issue, please contact Mary 
Ellen Woods at (216) 399-7686. 
More informationf on the results 
of these discussions will be 
forthcoming. 

Please contact me if you have con- 
cerns or information to pass on 
to Software AG or other users or if 
you're looking for other users with 
similar problems or environments- 
I may be able to expedite informa- 
tion sharing or to heighten Software 
AG awareness of problems or con- 
cerns. I would especially like to 
hear from you before Anaheim, 
where the next Executive Commit- 
tee meeting will be held, so that I 
can bring your issues to the table- 
and to the attention of Software 
AG's executives-at that time. 

Remember tha t  the ChangeIEn- 
hancement process is probably 
your best bet to get your ideas to 
Software AG on the direction of the 
communications products. I have 
been receiving numerous ones for 
NET-PASS, but few for other prod- 
ucts. Keep those cards and letters 
coming! 

Along that note, you probably have 
gathered by now that I am always 
happy to receive articles for the 

newsletter. If you have done any- 
thing interesting with communica- 
tions products, just jot down some 
thoughts and send or fax them to 
me-I will  expand and edit them 
for the newsletter. My fax number 
is (301) 493-9161. Also, please send 
your favorite COM-PLETE, 
ACCESS, ADABAS TPF, NET- 
PASS, or NET-WORK tool to Ed 
Simon (address in  the back of this 
issue) for inclusion on the COM- 
PLETE tools tape. He especially 
needs COM-PLETE 4.4 tools at this 
point. 

If you will be attending the confer- 
ence, don't miss the "COM-PLETE 
Performance and Tuning, and Tools 
Workshop," chaired by Ed Simon. 
This is probably the largest gather- 
ing of communications products 
users at  the conference in an open 
forum setting. We had a n  excellent 
discussion last year, and I hope 
that will be true this year also. 
Marius Abel, Norbert Gruettner, 
Steve McGuire, and Rick Shigaki 
will be there, representing COM- 
PLETE development and technical 
support. I'll be there too and I hope 
to see you all i n  Anaheim! 

Issues of Connections 
Future 
The Winter issue of Connec- 
tions will be the Post-Confer- 
ence issue. It will be a wrap- 
up of all the events that took 
place at the conference. Please 
send editorial to: 

Pam Ellis 
Software AG 
11190 Sunrise Valley Drive 
Reston, VA 22091 

Editorial Deadline 
Winter Issue-November 20th 
Note: This deadline has been 
extended 



Data Base 
Functional Area 
Representative 
Update 

Bob Becker 
Foremost Insurance Company 

In the past several CONNECTIONS 
articles I've started off with the 
weather conditions at the time of 
writing realizing that by the time 
the article is received by you, con- 
ditions could be vastly improved or 
worsened. With that in mind, we 
are experiencing our hottest most 
humid weather conditions so far 
this year, as today is the second day 
after the summer solstice. On the 
other hand, this spring and early 
summer has no where near 
matched the dryness and heat of 
1988. Only time will tell what this 
summer will be like for us folks 
in Western Michigan. 

After the CONNECTIONS articles 
which referred to the ADABAS 
centralized security interface, I had 
numerous calls from users all over 
the country expressing more inter- 
est in this critical new development. 
I can report to you that the ADABAS 
centralized security interface is 
still in development and is 
expected to be released with 
ADABAS 5.2. Also, in mid July, I 
will receive from the author of the 
interface in the UK all of the docu- 
mentation pertaining to its use. In 
my next newsletter article, 1'11 pass 
on the information that I obtain 
about the interface. It presumably 
will allow Top Secret ACF2 and 
RACIS environments to communi- 
cate and secure ADABAS data. 

As more and more of you are in- 
stalling ADABAS 5 into produc- 
tion, I would like to hear about your 
experiences with the product. We 
are presently in the preliminary 
stages of planning for our conver- 
sion and implementation of 

( ADABAS 5. If you have any 
J thoughts that I could share with 
20 others' please feel free to contact 

me. My office number is (616) 956- 
2664 or you may fax me at (616) 
956-4452. Another note on 
ADABAS 5. Our testing over the 
past 3 years has indicated ADABAS 
5 to be a true performance winner 
over ADABAS 4. As special interest 
group chairperson for performance, 
I would like to hear your comments 
about statistics that you acquire in 
your comparisons between 
ADABAS 5 and 4. 

Presently, I have several special 
interest group chairperson vacan- 
cies within the data base arena. The 
DBA Tools chairperson has recently 
become vacant. I wish to thank 
Mr. Galen Hansen for his excellent 
job at maintaining the DBA Tools 
tape over the past years. Please 
contact me if you could become the 
new DBA Tools representative. All 
that is required of you is to assem- 
ble the user written and submitted 
items onto one common Tools tape 
and send that tape on to Software 
AG for national distribution. 

Another vacancy is with the Edu- 
cationlDocumentation special in- 
terest group as well as Large Data 
Base SIG. If you have any interest 
in any of these 3 areas, I would be 
happy to talk with you. 

Technical Advisory Committees 
(TACs) are being formed to address 
specific areas within the data base 
product area. These TACs would be 
able to advise me, as the data base 
functional representative, on any 
and all technical issues associated 
with a given TAC product. If you're 
interested in providing me technical 
support on any of the following 
data base products, I would cer- 
tainly like to assign you as the TAC 
for that given product. The follow- 
ing products are within the data 
base functional area: ADABAS On 
Line Services, ADABAS VSAM 
Bridge, ADABAS DL1 Bridge, 
ADABAS Total Bridge, ADABAS 
IMSIDC Interface, ADABAS CICS 
Interface, ADABAS TSO Interface, 
Reflective Data Base, Text Retrieval, 
REVIEW, CONVERT (VMS) , 
NETWORK and ADANET or CTC. 
This appears to be a long list of 
products all related to the data base 
functional area, and at present I'm 
asking each of you to consider 
being a TAC. If you are interested 
and or using any of the above prod- 
ucts and would like to devote a 
small amount of time to the 
SAGGROUP organization as an 
advisor and to give input to the 

directions of these products, please 
let me know. 

The Executive Committee will be 
meeting several of the preceding 
days and for most of the conference 
in Anaheim. We will be working 
with Software AG closely to resolve 
your issues and concerns. 

Thank you for all of your interest 
and it's been good to hear from you 
over the past year. I hope to see 
each of you at the Anaheim confer- 
ence. Take care. 

End User 
Functional 
Representative 
Report 
Laura Jacobs 

During these hot months, it's hard 
to start thinking about Fall. Along 
with school starting and the leaves 
turning, Fall brings the Users' Con- 
ference in Anaheim. I'm very ex- 
cited about the conference. We will 
be having Special Interest Group 
Workshops for NATURAL CON- 
NECTION, SUPER NATURAL and 
NATURAL Elite. Each workshop 
will have representatives from 
Software AG and users who work 
with the product. This is the place 
to discuss policies and procedures 
with other installations, tips and 
techniques, future plans, etc. To 
prepare for the conference, jot 
down questions you have and bring 
them to the workshops. 

There seems to be confusion on 
what a Special Interest Group (SIG) 
is. A SIG focuses on one 
Software AG product for all ma- 
chines. The SIG communicates 
with other users through the con- 
ference, the Software AG Connec- 
tions, or through their own 
newsletter. Discussions range from 
the product itself, to how the prod- 
uct is used. An example of discus- 
sion for SUPER NATURAL is how 
does an installation train end users. 
Each installation is different and 
it's amazing how many new ideas 
are brought with each user. We 
have SIG's for SUPER NATURAL, 
NATURAL Elite, and NATURAL 
CONNECTION. Addresses for the 
chairpersons are in the back of 
Connections. Call them or drop a 
line to join a SIG. You can also sign 
up at the conference. 



End User 
-- - 

continued from page 20 

Clayton Clendinen has graciously 
volunteered to be the NATURAL 
CONNECTION Special Interest 
Chairperson. Tony Cortese is the 
NATURAL Elite Chairperson and 
Christine Burbank is the SUPER 
NATURAL Chair~erson.  

If you have any comments, com- 
plaints, problems or praises with 
the following software, please con- 
tact me. I'll try to help. The prod- 
ucts I'm responsible for are: SUPER 
NATURAL, NATURAL Elite Ex- 
tended function, NATURAL Elite 
Basic functions, NATURAL Elite 
Courseware, NATURAL CONNEC- 
TION Mainframe, NATURAL Doc- 
ument Manager, CON-NECT 
Standalone, CON-NECT Documen- 
tation Retrieval, NATURAL Spread- 
sheet, and NATURAL Statistical 
7 .  7 

Link. 

I hope to see you at the conference. 
Be sure to vote in  the SAG Users' 
Group elections. 

PREDICT 
continued from page 15 

Beta (fixes only; it was stated at 
the June 22 meeting that V2.3.3 
would be shipped in 6 weeks) 

PREDICT Version 3.1.0 

Old PREDICT Version 2.4 (Dec. 
89) 

PREDICT Version 4.0 

New product based on ADABAS 
Entire (No date) 

Version 3.1.0 Features 

Darmstadt installed a BETA test 
version of 3.1.0 in  Germany during 
August. There will be a general 
release of Version 3.1.0 in  Decem- 
ber, 1989. It will have two new 
features: 

-User Defined Entities (UDEs) 
-Application Control System 

Both are selectable items, but a 
price was not released to the User 

Panel. There was lengthy discus- 
sion on the new features being pro- 
vided for an additional cost. 
However, Chris Hopker stated that 
these features have always been 
presented as a cost item, regardless 
of the Version number, and they 
will not be released as public. 

User Defined Entities (UDEs) pro- 
vide the ability to create additional 
user-defined entities. The UDEs 
in  PREDICT V3.1.0 are different 
from the original project and differ- 
ent from what was presented at  
previous conferences. User Defined 
Entities will have 24  keywords, 
each with extended descriptions 
and short comments. A UDE can be 
defined as a 20 byte AlphalAlphan- 
umeric field. The dictionary user 
can define UDE relationships with 
any other PREDICT entity (either 
a SAG or a user defined entity ex- 
cept for elementary fields due to 
addressability). The UDEs work as 
normal wi th  PREDICT mainte- 
nance, all functionality is available: 
add, copy, modify, edit description, 
edit link, etc. A UDE can be con- 
nected to 50 other objects. The 
migrate utility does not currently 
migrate UDEs. 

The PREDICT User Panel collec- 
tively stated it would not  be ac- 
ceptable unless UDEs can be 
migrated. A vote was taken to de- 
termine if the migrate was a high 
priority and it was a unanimous 
vote that the migrate utility should 
support UDEs. Chris stated he 
would take this vote under 
consideration. 

The PREDICT Application Control 
System provides a control of 
NATURAL applications from a de- 
velopment phase to a control phase, 
with multiple test phases including 
module test, system test, and inte- 
gration test. 

PREDICT Product Direction: 

Several questions were asked about 
the direction of PREDICT amd 
PREDICT CASE and how the prod- 
ucts would be integrated. Chris 
emphasized that PREDICT CASE is 
a design tool together with a 
method to do it and PREDICT is 
basically an operational repository 
for your real, existing world. The 
direction of PREDICT development 
is for operational; not logical or 
data modeling or business design. 

A question was asked about the 
Standard File, the concept of the 
Standard File and how it would be 

effected in Version %an$ with 
PREDICT CASE. Chris stated he  
could not make a comment on that 
item at this time because he has 
taken the existing design and is 
reevaluating what is now necessary 
with the new products. 

Chris asked the User Panel an  in- 
teresting question. If there could 
possibly be one additional func- 
tionality added to Version 3, which 
of the two Software AG proposed 
enhancements would we choose? 
The two choices were: 

-PREDICT Object Security 

-Central User Integration 

But only one or the other was feasi- 
ble. The PREDICT Security feature 
protects PREDICT objects and the 
Central User Integration enhance- 
ment provides the functionality of 
a central security profile for all  
Software AG products, which 
would reside i n  PREDICT. 

Both items were discussed in detail 
and it was agreed that each of the 
enhancements provide Software AG 
Users with excellent administration 
management techniques that we 
have been seeking for some time. 
After lengthy debate, the Panel 
voted on PREDICT Object Security. 
Chris stated that our vote would 
be taken into consideration; how- 
ever, no commitment was made to 
either enhancement. 

PREDICT VERSION 3.1.0 will 
contain: 

Modified Menu Structures 

Integrated ADABAS Online Ser- 
vices (AOS) 

New attributes for databases and 
files 

Extended functionality of Incor- 
porates with AOS 

Extended functionality of com- 
pare ADABAS File 

Generate ADABAS File: Load 
and modify FDT 

Refresh ADABAS file (load null 
file) 

NATURAL Process: new logic 
documented in PREDICT 

DB2ISQL Functionality now 
supported by PREDICT: 

Incorporate DB2 databases 

continued on page 22 



PREDICT 
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Incorporate DB2 tablelview 

Generate DB2 tablelview 

Compare DB2 tablelview 

Compare DB2 databases 

"Static SQL" is now supported 
by Active Reference 

New Subsystem "Implement 
File" 

New User-exits for maintenance 

SAVE set functionality 

Extended program documenta- 
tion for third generation 
languages 

More entry points in Version 
3.1.0 

PREDICT is now prepared for 
ADANET 

e Processing Rules: free rules can 
be protected with NSS 

Extended LIST XREF command 

Extended functionality of verify 
of PFkeys 

PREDICT CASE is supported 

Modified Menu Structures: 

The menu structure has been 
changed. For all functions users 
will now pass one menu less than 
previously passed. Both "function" 
and "object" menu are different 
views to PREDICT, but the func- 
tionality is the same (i.e, all func- 
tions of PREDICT can be reached 
by both menus). Entering ' I ? "  will 
start a help system. All menus and 
pop-ups are now cursor-sensitive: a 
function will be selected by posi- 
tioning the cursor at the corre- 
sponding text on the screen. 

Integrated ADABAS Online 
Services: 

All functions of AOS, which are 
associated with files and elemen- 
tary fields, can now be handled 
with PREDICT, Also, if AOS is not 
installed at your installation, 
PREDICT has some additional func- 
tionality to assist you. New attri- 
butes have been added to the 
database object in PREDICT in or- 
der to provide information for 
ADABAS. This information about 
the ADABAS files is stored in a 

5 separate record which exists once 
I per fileidatabase. The function in- 
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corporate ADABAS file (formerly 
incorporate FDT) will show differ- 
ent behavior depending on whether 
AOS is installed or not. If AOS is 
installed, the file can be connected 
to PREDICT. 

New Attributes for Databases and 
Files: 

A database entry in PREDICT has 
new attributes. The size of a data- 
base is now stored and maintained 
in a different way. If the size of a 
database is specified it is checked 
against the files. The new attributes 
"Physical database-nr" and "Iso- 
lated database" will only be of 
interest if ADANET is installed at 
your site. 

Protection of Processing Rules: 

Processing rules can now be pro- 
tected. If NATURAL Security Sys- 
tem (NSS) is installed, it is now 
possible to specify NSS groups or 
users who are authorized to modify 
the rule. If a group is specified, all 
members of that group are author- 
ized to modify the rule. The default 
will be an unprotected rule. Up to 
10 groups or users can be linked 
to each rule. 

SAVE Set Functionality: 

The sets which are used by the 
Extended List command can also 
be created by active reference func- 
tions and by compare functions, if 
the result is a list of NATURAL 
objects which are registered via 
ACM. After the result list is dis- 
played, another screen will display 
and the dictionary user may specify 
user-IDS for each library where the 
set is to be saved. If user-ID is left 
blank the set will not be saved. 
If NSS is installed at your site, the 
user-ID must have access permis- 
sion for the list command of that 
specific library. 

Extended XREF Command: 

In NATURAL it is possible to han- 
dle global variables, which begin 
with " + ". This convention has not 
been supported with active refer- 
ence because the ACM could not 
identify the + variable names. This 
problem is now resolved. There 
will be correct cross-reference in- 
formation collected and stored once 
the program is cataloged (with the 
source reference). Please note: An 
object module being deleted with 
"uncat" will also delete the 
references. 

Miscellaneous Notes on Version 
3.1.0: 

PREDICT Version 3.1.0 can run 
under ADABAS Version 4; however, 
the new functionality provided by 
AOS and refresh files are not avail- 
able unless Version 3.1.0 is running 
under Version 5.0. 

There will be additional and im- 
proved documentation for Version 
3.1.0 which includes: 

Concepts and Facilities Manual, 

Programmer Command Process- 
ing Manual, 

Administrator's Reference 
Manual, 

User's Guide, and 

e Reference Card. 

PREDICT Version 4: 

PREDICT Version 4 development 
has been moved from the UK to 
Darmstadt and is based on 
ADABAS Entire with four layers 
(see attachement) : 

ADABAS 

ADABAS Entire* 

e "Extra Layer" * * (the German 
word did not translate well) 

PREDICT Functionality (i.e.: 
Add, Copy, Modify, etc.) 

"ADABAS Entire stores all the 
PREDICT objects 
**The "Extra Layer" helps 

PREDICT with PREDICT CASE 
and documentation generation 
from CONFORM 

Customized PREDICT reporting: 
Suppress data 
Resequence data 
Verify Application Integrity 
Verify Consistency: checks mod- 
ule, xref data and source 
timestamp 
Verify All (potentially an expen- 
sive command) 
User Sets: defined sets created by 
users 

Miscellaneous Notes on Version 
4.0: 

Chris stated that Version 3 will be 
supported for two full years after 
the release of Version 4. 

1990 User Panel Participation: 

User Panel members have the ex- 
ceptional opportunity to voice their 
organization's business require- 
ments and to participate with 



SAGGROUP ELECTIONS 
GET INVOLVED - VOTE! 

SAGGROUP Oncer Elections 

I am pleased to introduce our Nominees for this year's SAGGROUP 
elections. There are Four positions up for election this year: Vice 
President, Database Product Representative, Communications 
Products Representative and End User Products Representative. 
Each of these positions serve Two Year terms. The Candidates' 
Statements follow. 

As members of the SAGGROUP Executive Committee, these people 
are entrusted with a great deal of responsibility and leadership. The 
SAGGROUP Executive Committee represents all Users, their con- 
cerns and issues, to SAG Management and the Development Staff. 
It's YOUR job to decide which of the qualified candidates you want 
to select. Please make your decision carefully. 

Remember, too, SAGGROUP elections are only as meaningful as 
they are representative. GET OUT AND VOTE! 

- .A,= . - - 

As in the past, you will ~ z G  t i6 methods by which you can vote: 

1. Return the attached (see page 2) ballot by 6 October by mail 
or at the conference by 23 October. 

2. Or you may vote at the Conference. Ballots will be available 
near the Registration area. You may complete one there, but 
it must be deposited by 5 PM Monday 23 October. 

Please remember! We can only accept ONE Ballot per Customer 
Number. The first complete and accurate Ballot received will be 
counted. Subsequent ballots will be discarded. 
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1989 SAGGROUP BALLOT 
Vote for one 

Position Candidate for each position 

Vice President Colette Farabaugh 
(2 Year Term) ' Brock Norman 

Database Product Bob Becker 
Representative 
(2 Year Term) 

Communications Ellen Birch 
Product Chip Gilbert 
Representative 
(2 Year Term) 

End User Product Bob Cornstock 
Representative Laura Jacobs 
(2 Year Term) 

& 
Name: 
Customer Number:* 
* Note: All ballots must have a customer number to be counted. 

Company Name: 
Address: 

Return Ballots: 

1. By Mail: Must be received by 6 October 1989 

Mary Ellen Woods 
Inland Steel Company 
3210 Watling Street MC 5-000 
East Chicago, IN 46312, USA 

2. In Person: To Ballot Box (in Registration Area)! 
By 5 PM 23 October 1989 
at the International Users' Conference 
Anaheim, CA (22-26 October 1989) 

NOTE: ONLY ONE BALLOT WILL BE ACCEPTED PER CUSTOMER NUMBER 
Please review your decisions internally prior to returning a ballot. The first 
complete and accurate ballot received will be counted. 



SAGGROUP ELECTIONS 
CANDIDATES 

Colette Farabaugh 
Dole Packaged Foods 
Candidate for Vice President 

In accepting the nomination of, SAGGROUP Vice President I would like to thank those 
people who nominated me and encouraged me to run. Their faith and their support is 
very much appreciated. 

My experience with Software AG products began in 1980 with ADABAS V3.2.1 and 
NATURAL V1.l in a DOS environment at Castle & Cooke. Nine years later the com- 
pany is the same, although the name is now Dole Packaged Foods, the operating 
system is the same, but the Software AG products have changed and expanded to 
include PREDICT, NATURALIAF and SUPER NATURAL, plus assorted preprocessors 
and performance monitors. During those nine years I have held several SAGGROUP 
positions which I believe have given me the experience for serving as Vice President. 
I served several terms as the Sierra Pacific Regional Representative, consequently I 
am familiar with how the regional process works, and the region's role with SAG- 
GROUP. My first term as North American Area Rep introduced me to the Executive 
Committee and taught me the value of getting the regions involved. Subsequent 
terms as Area Rep, followed by a term as Nominations Chairman increasingly gave 
me the experience, understanding and confidence to allow me to be an effective 
member of the Executive Committee. Currently I am serving as the interim Vice 
President due to Bill Wagner's election as President. 

Throughout all these years I have learned that SAGGROUP depends, actually thrives 
on two things -- involvement and communication. Inclusion in SAGGROUP is guaran- 
teed by virtue of having a license, but membership does not automatically demon- 
strate involvement. And talking about changes, improvements, problems but not 
following up the words with involvement is nothing but that - just talk. It only be- 
comes communication when involvement is introduced into the equation. The first 
step to becoming involved is the hardest - I will admit to being 'volunteered' for 
Regional Rep the first time, as have many of you. And having many months go by 
before becoming aware of what SAGGROUP really was and what it did. Since that 
time I have learned that when the users cared enough to get involved Software AG 
listened. One example of this was the PREDICT ACM pricing issue. The users were 
concerned enough to get involved and communicate their feelings, both directly to 
SAG personnel and thru the Executive Committee. Software AG responded by drop- 
ping the charge for XREF - the communication was working. Now, with the direction 
of the Software AG product line diverging and growing at such a rate, a balance has 
to be achieved and maintained -- growth with quality, expansion but timely, profit but 
not unreasonably. This means the user commitment to and involvement in SAG- 
GROUP is more important than ever. 



Colette Farabaugh 
Candidate for Vice President (Continued) 

The Vice President's duties are not product oriented, with no direct charter to repre- 
sent a particular segment of the user community. However, I view the position as no 
less important than any other position. The holder is still committed to representing 
all users, and responsible for keeping the communications going with Software AG. 
More importantly I feel that the Vice President, or for that matter any of the officers, 
should actively and aggressively encourage individual user involvement at all levels 
within SAGGROUP. These include regional committees, SIGs, BIGS, user panels and 
the new Technical Advisor positions. 

If elected Vice President I will continue the dialogue with Software AG, attempting to 
strike a balance between what we as users want and what is best for the company 
and its products. And I would look for those of you users who have the gleam of 
involvement in your eyes, who are willing to commit your time and effort to keep 
SAGGROUP at its current high level of achievement. And get you started. 



SAGGROUP ELECTIONS 
CANDIDATES 

Brock Norman 
Blue Cross, Blue Shield of Oregon 
Candidate for Vice President 

I am currently the Senior Data Base Analyst for my corporation with my duties ranging 
from installing new software releases to tuning the system to application analysis. I 
have over seven years experience with ADABAS, NATURAL, and PREDICT used in 
various ways and environments. I am also the Northwest Regional Representative for 
SAGGROUP and, as such, hold the responsibility for ensuring that our quarterly meet- 
ings run smoothly with significant and interesting information being presented at 
them. 

As the Senior DBA, I see my tasks in one light: make the system perform to its 
maximum potential. If my corporation is to grow and succeed, the data base soft- 
ware must be utilized completely and efficiently in order to make a full contribution. 
This way of viewing my responsibilities causes me to carefully implement all phases 
of my tasks and also to quickly find resolution to any problems or questions that 
arise. 

In like manner, my role as Regional Representative has expanded my horizons, ena- 
bling me to aid the users in my region by providing them with relevant topics and 
knowledgeable speakers at our meetings. Desiring that they too succeed in their 
endeavors has brought solutions to the group along with the rewards of serving them 
in this way. 

I see the position of Vice President as being an even greater opportunity to practice 
my method of working. If given the privilege of serving in this office, I would give all 
my efforts to ensuring your full satisfaction and use of Software AG's products. 
Since the Business and Industry Groups report to the Vice President, my concern 
would be that their problems and questions received the quickest resolution and that 
current information flowed freely from the Executive Committee. Finally, I would work 
to help the management of Software AG realize their goal: "Provide business solu- 
tions" to users of their products. 

Thank you for your time, and I hope to be given the opportunity to serve the User 
Group in the office of Vice President. 
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Bob Becker 
Foremost Insurance 
Candidate for Data Base Functional Representative 

I would like to run one more term for the position of Data Base Functional Representa- 
tive. My previous involvement with the Software AG user group has been in several 
positions over the past 17 years. There have been two occasions when I have held 
positions on the Executive Committee. One term as Complete Product Representa- 
tive. Another term, holding the position as Technical Survey Chairperson. I am 
currently holding the position of Data Base Functional Representative. Over the past 
several years, I have been involved as the chairperson of the Special Interest Group 
in ADABAS performance. By giving several user presentations over the past years at 
the International Users' Conferences, I have had the opportunity to meet many of you 
and discuss various problems and solutions to ADABAS design and performance. By 
holding the position as the Data Base Functional Representative, it has allowed us as 
a user community to continue to grow with communications to Software AG about all 
data base related projects with ADABAS being a major component. 

I would like to continue to hold this position for one more term so that I may continue 
to serve the user community in the capacity of providing information about ADABAS 
to Software AG as the user community sees it as well as obtaining information from 
Software AG and passing that information on to you through various newsletter arti- 
cles from a user's perspective. 

By working with the Executive Community, I have found a means to better the overall 
communications between us as users and Software AG. This has allowed Software 
AG to understand. Understand our perspective and ensure that Software AG prod- 
ucts continue to head in the proper direction. 



SAGGROUP ELECTIONS 
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Ellen M. Birch 
Price Waterhouse 
Candidate for Communications Functional Area Representative 

My background consists of the following: 

a I have been the Communications Functional Area representative for the 
past two years; 

a I have worked with COM-PLETE and other Software AG products since 
1980, with fifteen years in systems programming and five years experience 
at Software AG, initially as COM-PLETE product support representative and 
then as manager of COM-PLETE support; 

a I have presented seminars on COM-PLETE debugging and on tuning COM- 
PLET 

I have ta g Work- 
shop" under contract as an outside consultant to Software AG; 

a As a consultant, I have tuned many COM-PLETE installations and per- 
formed numerous COM-PLETEIADABASINATURAL capacity planning 
studies; and 

I am currently a senior manager with Price Waterhouse, a COM-PLETEI 
ADABAS/NATURAL user. 

My continuing goals as the Communications Functional Area Representative will 
be : 

Fostering communication and involvement among the users of SAG com- 
munications products. I will continue to do this through my regular "tips" 
column in the newsletter, by functioning as a central routing point for in- 
formation and questions, and by encouraging member involvement; and 

Increasing communication between the communications products users 
and Software AG on issues such as support, product enhancement, train- 
ing, and documentation. 

My highest priority is to make sure all of you feel that you are part of an organiza- 
tion that is making a difference in your relationship with each other and with Soft- 
ware AG - and is helping you to use your SAG communications products to their 
fullest potential. Most importantly, I'd like to see your experience with your user 
group be as productive, satisfying, and fun as it can possibly be! 
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Chip Gilbert 
Martin Marietta 
Candidate for Communications Product Representative 

I have been an active user of the Software AG product line since 1985. During that 
time Martin Marietta has built a distributed data base between the IBM and VAX. This 
data base has the same data structures on both portions of the data base. We store 
the bulk of the data on one side and add a pointer to the data on the other portion of 
the data base. This data is stored and retrieved by the use of remote data access 
products. We helped Software AG build the communications products for a hetero- 
geneous environment by being both an alpha and beta site for these products. I 
currently serve as chairman of Technical Advisory Committee (TAC) for VAX NET- 
WORK products. 

As we approach the nineties, communication software has become a strategic asset 
and the key for information management. We are moving to the era of multiple data 
bases and multiple machines on different platforms. We are moving from remote 
data access to truly distributed data bases. The addition of the VAX, WANG and 
UNlX environments means that we have to communicate heterogeneously. Software 
AG has made a commitment to support distributed process. We also must guide 
Software AG in producing products that will solve our communication dilemmas. It 
depends on us the user community to integrate these products into our systems. 

I will also work with COM-PLETE users and present current issues to the Executive 
Committee. 

If elected as the Communications Product Representative, I want to establish dia- 
logue between the users and Software AG on the future direction of the product. 
Secondly, there is a need for a unified design for distributed data bases. Currently, 
the ADA-NET product is an IBM oriented design without regard to any architectural 
difference between the IBM, VAX, WANG, and UNlX environments. 

I would appreciate your support and the opportunity to represent you on the Executive 
Committee. 



SAGGROUP ELECTIONS 
CANDIDATES 

Bob Cornstock 
Planning Research Corporation 
Candidate for End User Product Representative 

As an employee of Planning Research Corporation (PRC) for more than 18 years, I 
have been a user of Software AG products since 1974. Working in support of the 
PRC McLean Data Center, I have held the positions of Data Base Administrator and 
Customer Support Manager. Moving on from the Data Center responsibilities I've 
worked as an ADABASINATURAL Technical Consultant on development projects and 
on to Applications Development Manager for PRC on large scale ADABAS develop- 
ment projects. I am currently in my second year as the SAGGROUP Eastern Regional 
representative and served as Vice-President prior to my current position. 

My goal as End User Product Representative would be to effectively represent the 
End User community to the Executive Committee and Software AG and to keep infor- 
mation flowing to and from the End User community using such facilities as "Connec- 
tions". As End User Product Representative I would strive to work in the following 
areas: 

Encourage Software AG to participate in an open dialogue with end users 
on a regular basis as to how the products are being used and allow the 
End Users to play a part in specifying software enhancements. 

Encourage creation of new Special Interest Groups as it pertains to End 
User Products and insure the End User Functional Area Representative 
(FAR) has required representation as it pertains to Technical Advisory 
Committee members. 

Actively solicit users of End User Products to exchange user profile in- 
formation among themselves. 

I am committed to provide the time and energy necessary to hold this position 
and ask only that you consider myself as your End User Product Representative. 



Laura L. Jacobs 
I<:.& Rochester Institute of Technology - ? - 
; .;- 
. - Candidate - .  s z = + r  for ., End - User Functional Representative 
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SAGGROUP ELECTIONS 
GET INVOLVED - VOTE! 

Deadlines 

1.  Return the attached (see page 2) ballot 
by 6 October by mail or at the conference 
by 23 October. 

2. Or you may vote at the Conference. Ballots 
will be available near the Registration area. 
You may complete one there, but it must be 
deposited by 5 PM Monday 23 October. 

Please remember! We can only accept ONE Ballot per 
Customer Number. The first complete and accurate Ballof re- 
ceived will be counted. Subsequent ballots will be 
discarded. 



PREDICT VERSION 4.0 

PREDICT FUNCTIONALITY: 
Add, copy, modify, etc. 

"EXTRA LAYER" 

ADABAS I 
ENTIRE 

I 
ADABAS (Native) 

'* German word does not translate well, temporarily called "extra layer" 

Software AG on the future of the 
data dictionary and related prod- 
ucts. If you and your organization 
are interested in participating in 
the 1990 PREDICT User Panel, 
please submit your name, address, 
phone number and job title to me: 

Patti Piccola 
Data Administrator 
BP Exploration 
5151 San Felipe 
PO. Box 4587 
Houston, Texas 77210 

All expenses for the PREDICT User 
Panel are the responsibility of the 
panel member's organization. 

At the Anaheim Conference, a list 
will be circulated during the 
PREDICT SIG meeting on Tuesday 
evening, October 24, to sign up for 
the 1990 PREDICT User Panel. 
Please check your conference 
agenda and procedures to confirm 
the correct time and place for the 
PREDICT SIG meeting. 

PREDICT User Panel members are 
encouraged to actively participate 
by providing constructive recom- 
mendations and suggestions for 
Software AG. 

PREDICT VERSION 4.0 

PREDICT FUNCTIONALITY: 

Add, copy, modify, etc. 
"EXTRA LAYER" * * 
ADABAS 
ENTIRE 
ADABAS (Native) 
Attachment 
""German word does not translate 
well, temporarily called "extra 
layer" 

1989 PREDICT 
PANEL MEMBERS 
Bill Mackowiak 
Senior AnalystIPredict Support 
Rochester Gas and Electric 

Joan Vragel 
Data Base Administrator 
Rochester Gas and Electric 

Paul Ruais 
Assistant Director DRA 
Boston University 

Stanley Weinronk 
Data Administrator 
Boston University 

Patti Piccola 
Data Administrator 
British Petroleum Exploration 
Lynne Dowling 
Data Base Analyst 
M.I.T. 
Sarah Tourville 
Sr. Data Base Staff Consultant 
EPA NCC Facilities Mgmt. Contract 
UNISY S 
Stuart Moisan 
DDA-PREDICT Application 
Support 
EPA NCC Facilities Mgmt. Cokract 
UNISY S 

Debby Lawson 
Manager, Production Environment 
& Quality Assurance 
Washington State University 

John Wirtanen 
Project Manager: Software AG 
Product Line 
TIAAICREF 

Richard Peth 
Data Base Administrator 
Department of Natural Resources 

Fred Frudden 
Manager, Data Administration 
A. H. Robbins 5 
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PREDICT PREDICT SIG Macintosh SIG 
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Jay McDermott 
Applications DBAIDA 
Westinghouse Savannah River Co 

Ron Johnston 
Project ManagerIDBA 
ATAC 

Also in Attendance from 
SOFTWARE AG: 

Chris Hopker, Software AG, Darms- 
tadt, Manager PREDICT 
Development 

Randy Kastendieck, SAGNA Cus- 
tomer Support 

Virginia Sullivan, SAGNA, 
PREDICT QA Analyst 

PRESIDENT'S 
MESSAGE 
continued from page 2 

this list to find the groups who deal 
with your special areas of interest. 
These groups give you an excellent 
opportunity to customize your con- 
ference agenda to your particular 
needs. 

The diversity of interests repre- 
sented by the SIGs and BIGS is, as 
always, only a small part of the 
total conference experience. As al- 
ways, there will be announcements 
from Software AG revealing their 
future directions. As always, there 
will be presentations by users de- 
tailing how they have used 
Software AG products to solve their 
business problems. And as always, 
there will be product demonstra- 
tions by Software AG to give us a 
look at solutions to the business 
problems of tomorrow. Equally im- 
portant, however, is the opportu- 
nity to share and exchange ideas 
with each other throughout the 
week-at breaks, at meals, at social 
functions. The value of the confer- 
ence increases with each person 
who registers; each registrant con- 
tributes a unique set of ideas and 
philosophies. We can all look for- 
ward to the most valuable confer- 
ence yet in Anaheim. 

Meeting 
Patti Piccola 
BP Exploration 
Administrative Product Representative 

A PREDICT SIG meeting will be 
held on Tuesday, October 24, in 
Anaheim. The new PREDICT SIG 
chairperson is Hannah Dolan, A.H. 
Robins. Hannah has been an active 
PREDICT user for numerous years 
and assisted in preparing a 
PREDICT presentation for the Nash- 
ville Conference. 

Software AG Representatives, 
Randy Kastendieck, SAGNA, Den- 
ver Customer Support and Greg 
Hagen, SAGNA, PREDICT Case 
Product Manager, are scheduled to 
attend the meeting. The SIG meet- 
ing will be a general session to 
discuss issues, questions, ideas and 
effective "work-arounds". Also, 
there will be multiple handouts 
available which answer frequently 
asked PREDICT questions. 

All interested PREDICT and 
PREDICT Case users should plan 
on attending Tuesday's meeting. 
This will be a ninety-minute ses- 
sion to be held following the sched- 
uled conference presentations. 
Please check your conference pro- 
ceedings and agenda to confirm the 
time and place of the PREDICT 
SIG meeting. If you are unable to 
attend the Anaheim conference but 
have a specific questionlconcern, 
submit the question in writing to: 

Hannah Dolan 
A.H. Robins 
1407 Cummings Drive 
P.O. Box 26609 
Richmond, Virginia 23262-6609 

If you have questions about the SIG 
meeting, please call either Hannah 
at 804-257-2550 or me at 713-552- 
6017. See you Tuesday night in 
Anaheim. 

Forming 
Gone are the dsys when micro and 
mainframe are as distant as two 
sides of the Grand Canyon. Micro 
to mainframe connectivity is an 
exciting reality. As Software AG 
enters the Macintosh world, the 
possibilities of cooperative pro- 
cessing are exciting. The products 
available from Software AG, such 
as NATURAL CONNECTION and 
NATURAL Architect Workstation, 
along with the Macintosh CPU, 
are extending powerful capabilities 
to the user. "We", at The University 
of Texas, are firm believers in the 
Software AG and Apple Macintosh 
platforms. Together, Software AG 
and Apple Computer are providing 
tools that extend the reach of the 
user into a world of information 
wealth. 

In talking with other sites using 
products from Software AG and 
Apple, enthusiasm is high. There is 
an eagerness to share information, 
ideas and solutions in implement- 
ing these new products and tech- 
nologies. Success stories already 
exist, and more are on the way. The 
purpose of the Macintosh SIG (Spe- 
cial Interest Group) will be to facil- 
itate the sharing of information 
among Software AG and Macintosh 
users. The possibilities for use of 
these "application" and "presenta- 
tion" platforms are tremendous, 
and your participation in this SIG 
will ensure that these solutions are 
implemented successfully. 

The 1989 International Users' Con- 
ference will be the first formal op- 
portunity for those currently using, 
or desirous of learning about the 
integration of Software AG prod- 
ucts and the Macintosh to meet 
together. If the canvassed interest 
level in a NATURALlMacintosh SIG 
is an accurate indicator, our first 
meeting will be valuable. Your par- 
ticipation will make this SIG a 
success. If you are interested in 
participating, or have input you 
would like to share, please give me 
a call or drop me a line as soon as 
possible. I can be reached at: 

Kim Arledge 
University of Texas at Austin 
Data Processing Department 
P.O. Box Q 
Austin, Texas 78713 
(512) 471-0265 

I look forward to talking with you, 
and seeing you in Anaheim! 



SUPER NATURAL and CON-NECT: 
Saving Time and Trees Together 
Lisa Crispin 
NATURAL Applications Group, 
Customer Support 

Like peanut butter and chocolate, 
SUPER NATURAL and CON-NECT 
are even better together with the 
release of SUPER NATURAL 2.3.1. 
SUPER NATURAL users can invoke 
CON-NECT from any SUPER 
NATURAL menu and return di- 
rectly to SUPER NATURAL when 
finished. SUPER NATURAL allows 

Step 1: Create the CON-NECT 
"Skeleton" Document 

From any SUPER NATURAL menu, 
type "C" on the command line to 
invoke CON-NECT (you may also 
enter CON-NECT directly, without 
going through SUPER NATURAL). 
Add a document with the text for 
the letter described above. For all I 

fields that will be variables, enter 
a variable name preceded by an 
ampersand (&). For our sample, the 
variables will be &fname, &minit, 
&lname, &dept, &lvdue, and 
&lvtake. You may enter CON-FORM 
text formatting commands, as well, 
if desired. 

continued on page 26 

end-users to take advantage of 
CON-NECT features that up to now Assigning Default COM-PLETE 
required some knowledge of 
NATURAL programming. CON- Printers Without TIBTAB Changes 
NECT in  turn allows SUPER 
NATURAL users to modify SUPER 
NATURAL reports in CON-NECT 
and distribute them electronically. 
Even experienced NATURAL pro- 
grammers will find SUPER 
NATURAL useful for creating pre- 
formatting procedures for CON- 
NECT documents. 

Creating Formatted CON-NECT 
Documents with SUPER 
NATURAL 

In the July 1989 issue of Connec- 
tions, Wendy Crist described how 
to use the COM-POSE statement 
in NATURAL and pre-formatting 
procedures in CON-NECT to create 
documents containing data auto- 
matically extracted from data base 
files. This is a great time-saving 
tool, but requires coding a 
NATURAL program. The following 
steps illustrate how a non-program- 
ming end-user can produce a pre- 
formatted CON-NECT document 
through SUPER NATURAL, with 
no knowledge of NATURAL pro- 
gramming required! 

If you have the July 1989 issue of 
Connections at hand, refer to it 
now. We will use the same example 
of a letter to be sent to all employ- 
ees who have over 55 days of leave 
available. The letter will contain 
each employee's first name, middle 
initial, and last name. It will be 
addressed to these employees at 
work and tell them their available 
leave and how much leave needs to 
be taken before June 1. 

Don Castleberry 
Delta Air Lines, Inc. 

logon was "approved." We could I then call ADABAS to determine 

Note: This article was scheduled to 
appear in  the Summer 1989 
Issue of Connections. By mis- 
take it was accidently omit- 
ted. The editor apologizes for 
any inconvenience this has 
caused. 

With the increasing number of ter- 
minals that were capable of gaining 
access to COM-PLETE through our 
VTAM network, we were facing 
an enormous task of maintaining a 
TIBTAB for all the printers i n  the 
system plus those users that still 
wished to have a default printer as- 
signed to their terminal. We de- 
cided the best answer was to set up  
an  ADABAS file containing, for 
each LU name of those VTAM ter- 
minals which were to have a de- 
fault printer, the LU name of the 
associated printer. We chose the 
VTAM address for both entries 
since it would be less common for 
those to change at our site than it 
would be for the COM-PLETE TIDs 
of the printers to change. 

We then wrote a version of the 
ULOGXl user exit to make a direct 
call to this ADABAS file at logon 
time. We found, by trial and error, 
that if a function code of 4 (undoc- 
umented) was received in the UIT- 
CODE field of the ULOG Info Table, 
we were at the point where the 

if there was a default printer LU 
associated with the terminal LU of 
the calling TID (found in the TIB- 
NAME field of the calling TID's TIB 
control block) and, if so, update 
the UITHC field i n  the ULOG Info 
Table with the minter 's LU name. 
The TIB controf block address 
could be found in register 5 (since 
we hadn't used it in the exit) or 
by using fields from the COMREG 
control block for calculations of 
offsets. One thing to be aware of is 
that this method for setting the 
default printer for a terminal would 
not override any hard copy defaults 
set up  through ULOGM or UDEF. 
The ULOG Info Table is documented 
in Appendix C of the COM-PLETE 
4.4 Systems Programmer's Manual 
and the TIB and COMREG control 
blocks are documented in the 
COM-PLETE 4.4 Control Blocks 
Manual. 

Along with this, we set up  a series 
of NATURAL programs for main- 
taining the ADABAS file. This al- 
lowed the capability to add, modify, 
or delete the default printer setups 
whenever it became necessary. The 
next time a user would log on, the 
change would be picked up  instead 
of having to wait for a TIBTAB to 
be assembled and initialized. This 
last capability has been helpful in  
our 24 hour shop. 5 



SUPER 
NATURAL 
continued from page 25 

Step 2: Create the SUPER 
NATURAL Transaction 

If you entered CONNECT from 
SUPER NATURAL, quitting out of 
CON-NECT will take you directly 
back to SUPER NATURAL. Or, in- 
voke SUPER NATURAL as you nor- 
mally do. 

Create a new SUPER NATURAL 
transaction and modify the modes 
for reporting: 

Report Type: Choose CON-NECT 
to produce a formatted CON- 
NECT document. 

Next, SUPER NATURAL will 
display the transaction specifica- 
tion screen so that you can enter 
selection criteria, calculations, 
logic statements, and select the 
fields to be inserted into the 
CON-NECT document. For our 
example, the selection criterion 
is: LEAVE-DUE GT 55. 

Now you must match the data 
base field names to the "&" text 
variable names for which they 
will provide data. To do this, you 
can enter the "&" variable name 
on the "text variable" column 
to the right of the field name. If 
you can't remember the text vari- 
able names, enter an "* "  in  posi- 
tion 1 of any text variable field. 
This will bring up  a window 
containing a list of all the "&" 

5 text variables in  your document, 
and you can enter the SUPER 
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Destination: A CON-NECT docu- 
ment may be routed to the 
screen, a printer, CON-NECT, or 
a PC file if NATURAL Connec- 
tion is installed. For this exam- 
ple, choose destination 
CON-NECT to send the formatted 
documents back to CON-NECT. 

Select the file(s) from which the 
variable fields are to be taken- 
in our example, EMPLOYEES. 
After you have chosen a file, 
SUPER NATURAL will bring up  
a screen listing all the documents 
in  your CON-NECT cabinet that 
contain text variables (those be- 
ginning with an  "&"). You can 
select from the list or enter the 
name of the document. 

NATURAL two-character field 
name for each text variable. 

For this example, match the fol- 
lowing fields with the CON- 
NECT text variables: 

FIRST-NAME 
MIDDLE-I 
NAME 
DEPARTMENT 
LEAVE-DUE 

You still need a field to provide the 
value of &lvtake. This value has 
to be computed, so you must define 
a user-defined field (call it LEAVE- 
TO-TAKE) and enter a calculation: 

LEAVE-TO-TAKE = LEAVE-DUE 
- 55 

Then match the user-defined varia- 
ble with the text variable: 

LEAVE-TO-TAKE &lvtake 

Step 3: RUN the SUPER NATURAL 
Transaction 

RUN the SUPER NATURAL trans- 
action. Since CON-NECT is the 
destination, the only output you 
will see in SUPER NATURAL is 
the number of records processed. 

Step 4: Look at the Results 

Go back into CON-NECT (type "C" 
on the SUPER NATURAL menu 
command line) and display the 
COM-POSE folder. Documents cre- 
ated with a CON-NECT type report 
transaction in SUPER NATURAL 
are stored in the COM-POSE folder. 
There will be one document for 
each record that met the selection 
criteria. The document will be 
named with the date and time and 
transaction name by which it was 
created. You may now edit these 
documents, send them, print them, 
or perform any CON-NECT func- 
tion wi th  them. These documents 
will look exactly the same as if 
you had created them i n  CON- 
NECT using a pre-formatting pro- 
cedure written i n  NATURAL. 

Sending SUPER NATURAL 
Reports to CON-NECT 

Any type of SUPER NATURAL 
report-not just the CON-NECT 
type report-can be sent to CON- 
NECT and stored as a CON-NECT 
document. Simply select CON- 
NECT as the report destination for 
the SUPER NATURAL transaction 
and run the transaction. In CON- 
NECT, these reports will be stored 

in the SUPER NATURAL folder 
with the date, time and name of the 
creating transaction. These may 
then be treated as any CON-NECT 
document; you may modify or send 
them, as needed. 

1 Creating a Pre-formatting 
Procedure with SUPER NATURAL 

If you prefer to format your docu- 
ments in  CON-NECT, rather than 
create them with the SUPER 
NATURAL transaction, you can 
create the SUPER NATURAL trans- 
action as described above. Then, 
instead of RUNning it, use the GP 
command to generate a prototype. 
Stow the prototype in an appropri- 
ate library (SYSCNT2 or SYSTEM). 
You now have a NATURAL program 
containing a COM-POSE statement 
which may be used as a pre- 
formatting procedure i n  CON- 
NECT. For more information, please 
refer to Wendy Crist's article i n  the 
June 1989 issue of Connections. 

SUPER NATURAL and CON-NECT 
are now working together to allow 
both programmers and end-users 
access to time- and paper-saving 
tools such as automatically format- 
ted documents and electronic dis- 
tribution of reports. 

COM-PLETE 
Fixes 
Tom Olson 
Communications Group, Customer 
Support 

We i n  Customer Support recognize 
that there is an  immense diversity 
of backgrounds i n  the various sup- 
port staffs of our customers. Some 
of you run  a 100% NATURAL envi- 
ronment, while others are Assem- 
bler and Cobol. Some of you have 
ADABAS shops and others of you 
are almost entirely VSAM. How- 
ever, the majority of our customers 
have shops with various mixtures 
of languages, access methods, ter- 
minal types, and networking 
environments. 

One thing all of you have in  com- 
mon is that sooner or later you will 
put a fix from our Communications 
Group into your environment, so 
it is the application of those fixes 
that is the topic of this article. 
NOTE: References in  this article to 

continued on page 27 
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COM-PLETE apply equally to 
COM-PLETE, COM-POSE, and 
ADABASITPF. 

Two Types of Load Modules 

The COM-PLETE load library that 
you receive on the distribution tape 
contains two types of load modules. 
The first I will refer to as the distri- 
bution modules and the second as 
the executable modules. All of the 
executable modules in the load 
library consist of distribution mod- 
ules that were linked during the 
creation of the library This is done 
to provide you with a shorter and 
simpler installation. 

Distribution modules can be 
thought of as functionally indepen- 
dent pieces of code that will later 
make up an executable module. For 
example, if you have modules A, 
B,  and C, thky may be linked to 
form module UTIL. This is the way 
that the COM-PLETE nucleus and 
all of the utilities are created. For 
your convenience, a member in 
the source library, JCLLINKS, con- 
tains the various linkage control 
statements that are required to re- 
create the executable modules. 
This member contains multiple 
steps, with each step set up to cre- 
ate one executable module. 

Executable modules can be made 
up of one or more distribution 
modules. In the case where only 
one module exists, the distribution 
and executable module are one 
and the same, rather than two sep- 
arate entries. An example of this 
is TTJIJES2. It is in its executable 
format and there are no "distribu- 
tion" modules in the library that 
need to be linked to create it. Con- 
versely, a list of the distribution 
modules that create the COM- 
PLETE nucleus contains over 200 
entries. 

A Typical Fix 

What does a typical fix look like? 
The following sample should help 
you to understand what you will 
be receiving and how it relates to 
two basic maintenance 
philosophies. 

NAME 
1 

VER 
6 

REP 
9 

NAME 
12 

VER 
17 

REP 
21 

OOAB 
7 

OOAB 
10 

TLAMVTAM TLAMVTAM 
13 14 

LOADLIB (COMPLETE) 
4 5 

LOADLIB (COMPLETE) 
15 16 

Figure 1: Anatomy of a Fix Member 

An Explanation of the Fields in 
Figure 1 

10. Offset within the module to be 
used with data in 11. 

1. Directive to the zap u t i l i t ~  that I ll. Data to be used 
program identificaiion informa- 12. Same as tion follows on this line. 

2. Specifies to the zap utility the 
external module name. This 
is the name of the member in 
the directory of the load library. 
When 2 and 5 are the same, 
this should be the executable 
module. When 2 and 5 differ, 
this is the distribution module 
name. 

3. Specifies the internal module 
name to the zap utility For you 
Assembler programmers, this 
is the CSECT name. 

4. The zap utility treats this as 
comments. It is a directive to 
the programmer to check field 
5. 

5. The zap utility treats this as 
comments. This is the external 
name of the executable mod- 
ule. You should be using this 
field in conjunction with your 
own maintenance philosophy 
to direct your actions. 

6. Directive to the zap utility that 
validation information for the 
named module follows on this 
line. 

7. Offset within the module to be 
used with data in 8. 

8. Data to be used. 

9. Directive to the zap utility that 
replacement information for 
the named module follows on 
this line. 

13. Same as 2. When 13 and 16 are 
the same, this should be the 
executable module. When 13 
and 16 differ, this will be the 
distribution module. 

14. Same as 4. 

15. The zap utility treats this as 
comments. It is a directive to 
the programmer to check 16. 

16. The zap utility treats this as 
comments. This is the external 
name of the executable mod- 
ule. You should be using this 
field in conjunction with your 
own maintenance philosophy 
to direct your actions. 

17. Directive to the zap utility that 
validation information for the 
named module follows on this 
line. 

18. Offset within the module to be 
used with data in 19. 

19. Data to be used. 

20. Treated as comments by the 
zap utility. Indicates the source 
instruction represented in 19. 

21. Directive to the zap utility that 
replacement information for 
the named module follows on 
this line. 

22. Offset within the module to be 
used with data in 23. 

23. Data to be used. 

continued on page 28 
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24. Treated as comments by the 
zap utility. Indicates the source 
instruction represented in  23.  

Adopting a Maintenance Philosphy 

Now that you have seen a typical 
zap format, what is it that you 
could do with it? COM-PLETE 
maintenance is distributed i n  a 
form that will easily allow you to 
adopt one of two maintenance 
philosophies. 

1. Apply fixes directly to the exe- 
cutable module and do the test- 
ing you feel is necessary to 
verify that the fix corrects the 
problem. 

When you are confident the 
problem is resolved or the fix 
does what was intended, apply 
the fix to the appropriate distri- 
bution modules. This approach 
permits a window of test time 
that will allow you simply to 
relink the executable module in 
order to back off a fix that does 
not perform to your satisfaction. 

Bear i n  mind that if there is 
more than one fix on the execut- 
able module that was not applied 
to the distribution module(s), 
you could possibly "lose" fixes. 
It does provide a very easy-to- 
use backout mechanism. 

2 .  Apply the fix to the distribu- 
tion module(s) and then re- 
link the appropriate 
executable modules. 

To backout a fix, you would cre- 
ate a second fix which would 
be a copy of the first, but you 
would change all of the control 
statements that were VER to 
REP and all those that were 
originally REP to VER. You 
would then apply your backout 
fix to the distribution module(s) 
and relink the corresponding 
executable module(s). 

This second methodology closes 
the window where a fix could 
be lost, but increases the diffi- 
culty of backing off fix(es). One 
alternative you might consider 
for this situation is to create the 
linked module in  a test library 
concatenated ahead of your 

COM-PLETE load library i n  the 
STEPLIB DD statement in the 
COM-PLETE startup JCL. Then 
if you find it necessary to back 
out the updated module, you 
could simply scratch the mem- 
ber from the test library. If the 
test library copy is good, you 
would either copy it to the per- 
manent load library or rerun the 
link using the permanent load 
library as the SYSLMOD target. 

Load Library Modules 

Regardless of which maintenance 
philosophy you adopt, there are a 
couple of considerations to make 
for COM-PLETE. The PGMLIB con- 
tains copies of many of the modules 
which exist in the load library. If a 
new copy of one of these modules 
is put into the load library, remem- 
ber to use TULIB or ULIB to delete 
and recatalog the new version. Al- 
ways ensure that your new program 
is in a STEPLIB data set ahead of 
any other copies so that your new 
module is the one picked up. If a 
transient module, identified by the 
first two characters being "TT", 
is being recataloged, make certain 
activity on COM-PLETE is quiesced 
or that COM-PLETE is down. We 
have encountered situations where 
COM-PLETE abended sometime 
during or immediately after the re- 
cataloging process. 

Modules in the RESIDENTPAGE 
list need an  additional step per- 
formed before a zap will be i n  ef- 
fect. The operator command 
PGM,REFRESH,program-name 
must be issued before the new rou- 
tine will be in place. RESIDENT- 
FIX modules are not refreshable 
and require COM-PLETE to be shut 
down and reinitialized. 

Recording Your Fixes 

There are a number of variations 
on these two approaches and you 
may be using one of them. Regard- 
less of the specifics of your mainte- 
nance approach, it is important to 
be able to tell which fixes are on 
and where they are. For those of 
you who have multiple copies of 
software running, it is a great time- 
saver to keep good records. Whether 
those records are an online system 
on a mainframe or PC or just a 
notepad is unimportant as long as 
you can tell what is on and where. 

Questions and 
Answers 
Karen Fredrich 
NATURAL Applications Group, 
Customer Support 

Several NATURAL 2 add-on prod- 
ucts have their own system files, 
but do  not have a way to identify 
them to the NATURAL nucleus 
(i.e., a NATPARM). PREDICT and 
NATURAL Security have been pro- 
vided NATPARMs, FDIC and FSEC, 
to identify their system files. SUPER 
NATURAL and CON-NECT also 
have system files, but FNSN and 
FCNN are not valid NATPARMs. 

This leads to some commonly- 
asked questions: 

Q. How do I tell NATURAL 2 where 
the CON-NECT 2 system files are 
defined without a NATPARM? 

A. The LFILE parm can be used to 
identify them dynamically, or the 
NTFILE can be specified in the 
NATPARM module. 

Q. Where are these parms 
documented? 

A. The NATURAL 2 Administra- 
tion Manual, Profile Parameters 
section. 

Q. What is the format? 

A. The format for these parms is: 

NATURAL parm specification- 

NTFILE ID = 999,DBID = 999, 
FNR= 999,PASSW = NO,CIPH=NO 

Dynamic specification- 

LFILE = (ID,DBID,FNR,PSWD, 
CIPHER) 

Q. Is there a n  example or an  
explanation? 

A. Yes! Here is an example of how 
to define a SUPER NATURAL 
(NSN) help file on data base 140, 
file 15: 

NTFILE 
ID=245,DBID=140,FNR=15 
LFILE = (245,140,15) 

continued on  page 29 



ID SYSTEM FILE 
NUM DESCRIPTION 

222 CONNECT V2 HELP TEXT 
223 TELEX SYSTEM FILE 
224 CONFORM SYSTEM FILE 
22 5 NATURAL MODELING FILE-SAGNA 
227 CONSTRUCT FILE -SAGCDN 
228 SUPERNATURAL FILE-PHYSICAL DATABASE USER FILE 
229 CAI FILE -SADCDN 
230 TRS FILE-STRUCTURE DESCRIPTION 
231 TRS FILE-DICTIONARY 
232 TRS FILE-DOCUMENTS 
233 TRS FILE 
234 TRS FILE 
235 TRS FILE 
236 TRS FILE 
237 TRS FILE 
238 TRS FILE 
239 NATURAL ONLINE SYSTEM AID 
240 COM-PLETE SECURITY SYSTEM FILE 
241 REVIEW SYSTEM FILE 
242 COM-PLETE SECURITY FILE DEFINITION 
243 NATURAL PRODUCTIVITY CENTER FILE-SAGNA 
244 SUPERNATURAL SYSTEM FILE (HEADER) 
245 SUPERNATURAL SYSTEM FILE (HELP) 
246 SUPERNATURAL SYSTEM FILE (USER) 
247 TEXT RETRIEVAL SYSTEM FILE 
248 SUPERNATURAL SYSTEM FILE (FILE) 
249 DICTIONARY SYSTEM FILE 1 
250 DICTIONARY SYSTEM FILE 2 
251 CONFORM SYSTEM FILE 

""THE ABOVE INFORMATION IS EXTRACTED FROM THE NATURAL 214 
NTFILE MACRO. 

Figure 1-LFILEINTFILE Identifiers, 
Extracted From the NATURAL 214 NTFILE Macro 

ID = each system file is assigned a 
unique number that is used by the 
NATURAL nucleus for identifica- 
tion. ID = 245 identifies a NSN help 
file whenever NSNINATURAL 2 
are installed. The ID number is not 
variable and is predetermined by 
Software AG. 

DBID = the physical ADABAS 
number where the NSN help file is 
loaded. 

FNR = the file number of the NSN 
help file, not the NATURAL system 
file number. 

Q. How can I verify that all of the 
file IDS are correct? 

A. A quick and easy way to verify 
is through the system profile 
function. 

Log on to SYSDBA, selection op- 
tion 1 to display system file infor- 
mation. This will display all of 
the system files assigned to 
NATURAL 2. The system file 
names will be displayed, not the ID 
numbers. 

Q. Where can I get a list of these ID 
numbers? 

A. Software AG provides a list of 
LFILEINTFILE identifiers (refer to 
Figure 1) in the NTFILE macro. 
This macro is located in the 
NATURAL 2 source library. 

Tips for Pop-up Help Using NATURAL 
ELITE 1.4 

Susan Lowy 
Instructional Technology Group 

Now that we have the new version 
of NATURAL ELITE and we can 
work in the NATURAL 2 environ- 
ment, there are some wonderful 
things we can do to enhance our 
ELITE courses. The most notable is 
the use of pop-up windows. 

NATURAL ELITE uses the 
NATURAL 2 Map Editor when cre- 
ating maps. We create regular 
maps, interactive maps, and help 
maps. In the past, we had full- 
screen help, which was invoked 
when the student pressed PF12 (or 
its equivalent). That help screen 
is still available; however, we can 
now add pop-up help screens. 

Pop-up help requires at least one 
input field for the student to invoke 
the help, which is done by entering 
a question mark (you might indi- 
cate that by saying: Enter a ?-). 
Pop-up help can be attached to the 
original map, either on the "Define 
Map Settings" screen (where the 
help pops up as a default every 
time the student enters a question 
mark-mostly for quizzes), or on 
the "Extended Field Editing" 
screen (where the help is specifi- 
cally for that field; this overrides 
any default help). 

Creating a Pop-up Help Screen 

When you create full-screen help 
[invoked with PF12), you would 
initialize a help map (H function 

code) and proceed to the map edi- 
tor. You enter the text andlor 
graphic and then stow it. 

To create a pop-up help screen, 
initialize a help map, but on the 
"Define Map Settings" screen, ad- 
just the Pagesize and the Linesize 
to a smaller setting (default is 23 x 
79, respectively), and then proceed 
to the map editor. Always make 
the area larger than you might 
need; you can always make the area 
smaller, but you cannot enlarge it 
after you have stowed the map. If, 
after entering the text, you wish 
to make the area smaller, stow the 
map first, then adjust the size. 
Otherwise, you will lose all of your 
text! 

continued on page 30 



***** N A T U R A L / E L I T E ***** 
- ADD MENU U N I T  - 

U N I T  NAME: NSESHELP 

MAP NAME: SNSEI07M 
HELP MAP NAME: 

UP TO 5 ANSWERS 
- - - - - - - - - - - - - - -  
1: ? 
2: 
3 :  
4:  
5 :  

U N I T  DESTINATIONS 

1: NSEIEXITELITE-  
2 : 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  
P F l  MAIN PF2 BACK PF3 STOP PF12 HELP 

Figure 1: Add Menu Unit Screen 

After you have created the pop-up 
help, go to the original map that 
will use this help and attach it as 
screen-help (on the "Define Map 
Settings" screen). At this point, you 
can test your map to see if your 
pop-up help works by entering a 
question mark in the input field(s). 

nance component of Authoring. 
The full-screen help screens are 
attached to the maps next to the 
field HELP MAP NAME, just as you 
are used to doing (though now we 
can have full-screen help with 
menus, quizzes, and text screens!). 
For maps that will have one input 
field to invoke the pop-up help, you 
should use the MENU-type unit. 
If you use a quiz-type unit, your 

students would receive feedback, 
but would also be scored if they 
didn't enter a question mark. You 
could give them two chances, the 
first telling them to enter the ques- 
tion mark. However, any input 
would be counted as part of the 
student's overall score. 

You would complete your menu 
screen as shown in Figure 1. The 
destination is the next screen. If 
the student chose not to enter the 
question mark, the default would 
also be the next page. 

Maintaining Your Maps 

Now you are ready to maintain 
your maps using the Unit Mainte- 



EASTERN REGION 

Frank Gillett 
Spoke On "How 
to Turn On Data 
Administration" 
Debbie Watson 
Technalysis Corporation 

The quarterly meeting of the East- 
ern Region Software AG Users' 
Group was held at the Holiday Inn 
in  Crystal City, Virginia on Tuesday, 
April 17, 1989. The meeting was 
called to order at 9:00 a.m. by Pres- 
ident Bob Comstock and this meet- 
ing represented 100 + attendees. 
The following orders of business 
were covered: 

General Business 

The General Business information 
was passed on to members in writ- 
ing so that Rose Ours, the ADABAS 
Representative could present infor- 
mation regarding ADABAS 5. Bob 
then turned the meeting over to 
Barry Kropf, the Vice President of 
the Eastern Region Software AG 
Users' Group. 

ADABAS 5-Rose Ours of MCI 

Rose Ours gave an update on in- 
stalling ADABAS 5 pointing out 
some problems she had 
encountered: 

ADAINV Utility will sometime 
get a Point of No Return Error 
Message when it abends. When 
this message is received you 
cannot just execute the Recover 
Utility, you have to Restore the 
file and then rerun the invert. 

ADALOD Utility abended and 
the ADAREP showed the mes- 
sage that "The File was in Load 
Status." The Recovery Utility 
cannot be run at this point. The 
file needs to be deleted and 
reloaded. 

ADALOD Utility problem with 
specifying NUMREC. If you 
specify NUMREC and the NUM- 
REC specified is less than the 
number of input records you will 
receive a return code of 0 instead 

of 4. Rose is expecting a Zap for 
this and will be cleared up in 
SM04. Rose passed out papers 
regarding problems she had 
encountered. 

DATA ADMINISTRATION-Frank 
Gillett of A.H. Robins 

Frank Gillett of A.H. Robins gave a 
presentation on "How to Turn On 
Data Administration." The need for 
Data Administration at A.H. Robins 
came about so that they would have 
the capability to identify how and 
where their data was used. Frank 
described the documentation relat- 
ing to data administration as Pro- 
gram Functions, System Functions 
and File Definitions. Previously, 
A.H. Robins did not have a stan- 
dardized method of documenting 
their various systems. The Data 
Administration effort was to stan- 
dardize this documentation and 
make it meaningful. A.H. Robins 
decided that the best way to achieve 
this goal was to use PREDICT and 
ACM. The goals of Data Adminis- 
tration was to provide a dataman- 
agement facility where data was 
defined and consistent and suppor- 
tive of the needs of their shop. 
PREDICT is used to catalog and 
maintain all of A.H. Robins docu- 
mentation. ACM is used to capture 
data usage information. Data 
Administration trained their staff 
in the use of PREDICT and ACM 
identifying the benefits of using 
each one. The main area docu- 
mented is the Production Environ- 
ment. A.H. Robins is very pleased 
with the results of the Data Admin- 
istration effort and intends to con- 
tinue with this effort. 

NATURAL 2 Processing-Sheri 
Kosh of Software AG 

Sheri Kosh of Software AG gave the 
next presentation on NATURAL 2 
Processing. Sheri discussed differ- 
ent aspects of NATURAL 2 
including: 

NATURAL 2 Environment-The 
Operating System, A NATURAL 2 
Architecture Overview, Dynamic 
Storage Usage, TP Interface and 
Screen Work Areas, Buffer Pool 
Architecture and Setups, Local 
Buffer Pool areas and Global 
Buffer Pool Areas. 

NATURAL 2 Objects-Main 
uses of each NATURAL 2 Object, 
Interaction of NATURAL 2 Ob- 
jects, and creation of 
NATURAL 2 Objects. 

Internal Processing-Buffer 
Usage during NATURAL 2 
Processing. 

Sheri provided insight into the 
NATURAL 2 environment and an- 
swered several questions regarding 
problems. 

User Open Forum Discussion 

This time slot was offered to allow 
users to discuss their experiences 
andlor problems in using ADABAS 
and NATURAL. Our thanks to 
Sheri Kosh of Software AG for stay- 
ing on and interfacing with these 
users. 

SOUTHEASTERN REGION 

Dr. James Thomann 
Presented 
NATURAL 2 
Internals 
On May 12, 1989, The Southeastern 
Users' Group held it 's Spring meet- 
ing at the Westin Lennox in At- 
lanta, Georgia. The meeting was 
attended by around 70 attendees 
representing 37 companies. The 
meeting was preceeded by a three 
day ADABAS 5 Internals Class 
taught by Becky Albin of 
Software AG's Educational Depart- 
ment at Reston, VA. 

The Winter meeting will be held 
on January 22, 1990, at the Grovs- 
ner Resort Hotel in  Disney Village 
near Orlando, FL. A free 
NATURAL 2 Standards Seminar 
will be conducted the following 
day. The reservation number for the 
Grovsner is 1-800-624-4109. 

The following orders of business 
were covered: 

1. General Business 

2. NATURAL CONNECTION 3.1.1 
Clayton Clendinen 
Orlando Utilities Commission 

continued on page 32 



I 3,  DABAS AS Text Retrieval System 
Gretchen Werner 
Software AG 

4. NATURAL 2-Selected topics 
on how NATURAL 2 works 
Dr. James Thomann 
Software AG 

General Business 

A special thank you was extended 
to Dan Burger of Gold Bond for 
his hard work during the past 12 
months while he was the group's 
Secretary, Class Registrar, and 
Treasurer. David Hamacher of UNI- 
SYS at the EPA was elected as the 
new Secretary. Dan will stay on as 
Registrar and Treasurer. 

Clayton Clendinen informed the 
group that as of December, the bul- 
letin board was opened up to peo- 
ple outside of the User group. Any 
'neat' things to go on the bulletin 
board would be appreciated. 

I 

Keyword Search 

Call-Level Interface 

NATURAL 2-Selected topics on 
how NATURAL 2 works 

Dr. James Thomann of Software AG 
gave a presentation on some of the 
internal functions of NATURAL 2. 

NATURAL 2 Architecture 
Overview 

NATURAL 2 Nucleus 
Compiler and Optimizer 
Command Processor 
Execution Processor 
NATPARM Module 
NATTEXT Module 
TPlBatch Interface 

Dynamic Storage 

System Control Block 
Threads 
Roll Files 

NATURAL CONNECTION 3 -1.3 I Dynamic Storage Usage 

User Buffer (MSIZE) 
Clayton Clendinen gave a presenta- Source Area (ESIZE) 
tion on his experiences with NATURAL 2 Source 
NATURAL CONNECTION 3.1.1. Statements 

Topics covered included: 

0 Administration Facility 

LAN Support 

DOS Shell 

Application Execution 

File Conversion 

Task Automation 

File Transfer 

NATURAL CONNECTION as a: 
Programmer Productivity Tool 
Natural Maintenance Tool 
Platform for Cooperative and 

Distributed Processing 

ADABAS Text Retrieval System 

Gretchin Werner of Software AG 
gave a presentation on the newly 
released ADABAS Text Retrieval 
System (TRS) and the NATURAL. 
interface to this product, NATURAL 
Document Manager Interface (NDM). 

TRS is coded in assembler and 
utilizes 3 logical ADABAS files: 

Definition 

Vocabulary 

Document Summary 

5 TRS features include: 

32 Keyword Management 

Stack 
RETAIN Command-id Table 
PAIPF Key Tables 
GDAs 
Graphics Work Area 
Subroutine Stack 

Object area (USIZE) 
NATURAL 1.2 Object Module 

Executing 
ADABAS CGntrol Blocks 
Data Areas needed for 

Compiling 

Uses of each NATURAL 2 Object 

0 Interfaces of NATURAL 2 Object 

Processing Rule Summary 

NATURAL 2 Internal Processor 

Buffer Usage during Processing 
CICS Interface Processing 

MIDWEST REGION 

Jack Hauber 
Looks for 
Education and 
Training 
Suggestions 
Debbie Carlsen 

The Midwest Region Users' Group 
meeting was held on March 20. 
1989 in-chicago and was hosted by 
Waste Management. The meeting 
was opened at 9:10 am by President 
John DeNatale. Ninety-five users 
attended the meeting. 

First on our agenda was an intro- 
duction of Jack Hauber, Director of 
Training, Software AG, Reston. Jack 
is looking for ways to expand train- 
ing in terms of quality, quantity 
and scope. Some of the ideas 
include: 

Sponsor non-product related 
seminars 

Package advanced seminars 
around user group meetings 

Data ~ i e a s  Geeded for Jack is looking for ideas and sug- 
NATURAL 2 Execution gestions and can be reached at 

NATURAL 2 Object execution (703) 391-6652. Call him and tell 
information him your ideas and needs for train- 

File Buffer (FSIZE) 
ing and education. 

DDMs during Compilation Jack was followed by Roy Parkin- 
NATURAL 1.2 Global Variables son, Software AG Applications and 
Compile Symbol Tables Services presenting ADABAS 5 

Sort Buffer (SORTSZE) data base design. ADABAS 5 has 
bigger block sizes which should Temporary Storage for On-line 
give better performance. New fea- Sorts tures including minisn, subfields, 

Debug Buffer (DSIZE] superfields, hyperdescriptors and 
Output for ADALOG Utility unique superdescriptors were ex- 

plained in detail. Automatic fea- TP interface and Screen Work 
tures includes ET buffering, Areas 

Page Buffer (LS*PS) multiple update threads, format 

Screen Buffer translations in the work pool and 

Terminal Buffer new buffer flush algorithm were re- 
viewed with the advantages each 

Buffer Pool Architecture provides. Changes to prefetch, util- 

Local Buffer Pool ity functions and close command 

Global Buffer Pool statistics were also included. 

continued on page 33 
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After lunch, Art Burkett, Manager were all pleased he was willing to Chicago Area SAG User Group. 
of Customer Service, Software AG, I share his experiences with the I Meets everv month. 
presented Service Connection-a 
value added service for the user 
community. This was a n  updated 
version of the presentation given in 
Nashville; but for many attendees 
this was a new experience. The 
idea was well received. Price and 
release date is not yet available. 

Regional Business-The bylaws 
were amended as follows: 

1. From: Voting is available to all 
members with each in- 
stallation being entitled 
to one vote for each major 
Software AG product. 
Major Software AG prod- 
ucts are ADABAS, 
NATURAL and 
COMPLETE. 

To: Voting is available to all 
members with each 
member organization 
being entitled to one 
vote. 

2 .  From: These bylaws may be 
amended at any regional 
meeting by a two-thirds 
vote. 

To: These bylaws may be 
amended at any regional 
meeting by a simple 
majority. 

Both of these changes bring the 
bylaws to match the International 
bylaws. 

Rejected were: 

1 .  Change meetings from 2 to 3 per 
year. 

2. Change election of officers- 
Vice President would assume 
presidents role after 1 year with 
new Vice President to be elected 
annually. 

Copies of the amended bylaws will 
be included in  the next regional 
mailing. 

Regional officers will be elected at 
the next meeting. A nominating 
committee of Charles Wyszomirski 
from American Bar Association, 
Chicago and Roger Wilson, City of 
Milwaukee was formed. If you have 
an interest in running for an office, 
contact either of the committee 
members. 

group. The sample code provided 
was especially useful. 

The next meeting will be hosted by 
the City of Milwaukee, probably 
the second week of September. 

Madison Area 
SAG User Group 
is Going Again 
John DeNatale 
Midwest Region President 

After much convincing and a lot of 
work on the part of Roger Wilson, 
City of Milwaukee, the Madison 
Area SAG User Group will be 
meeting on a regular basis. The 
Madison Area SAG User Group met 
on June 23, 1989. The turn out was 
a bit sparse but it's a start. 

The meeting was opened with re- 
marks by Roger Wilson, followed 
by a product update by Dean Sal- 
erno of Software AG. Dean also 
answered questions about what was 
going on i n  the Wisconsin area 
with regard to customers using or 
considering using Software AG 
products. 

Next there was a presentation on 
ADABAS 5, given by SSR Andy En- 
gels. Also, Andy highlighted some 
of the internal changes to ADABAS 
5 for the users who are planning 
to install the product. 

The meeting featured a presenta- 
tion by John Havey of Elkay Manu- 
facturing on "Using Inline 
Processing Rules in  NATURAL 2." 
This presentation was a repeat of 
the one given to the Chicago Area 
SAG User Group and at  the last 
Midwest Regional Meeting. 

Our final item on the agenda was 
to get volunteers to help Roger Wil- 
son keep the group meeting on a 
regular schedule. If you are inter- 
ested i n  helping out or attending 
the next Madison Area SAG User 
Group Meeting, contact Roger Wil- 
son at the City of Milwaukee (414) 
278-2061. The next meeting of the 
Madison Area SAG User Group 
will be on November 16, 1989. The 
location is undecided at this time. 

Madison Area SAG User Group. 
Meets quarterly. 

Michigan Area SAG User Group. 
Meets quarterly. 

Kansas Area SAG User Group. 
Meets quarterly. 

Twin Cities SAG User Group. 
Meets bi-monthly. 

Please contact me for information 
about these local user groups. I 
realize that it is difficult at times to 
attend the Midwest Regional meet- 
ings. These local user groups do 
provide some of the same oppor- 
tunities in  sharing information 
about using Software AG products. 
As a reminder to the local user 
groups, continue to send me min- 
utes from your meetings. I like to 
feature the user groups i n  the arti- 
cles. This gives everyone a chance 
to find out how others are using 
Software AG products. I do not 
have the opportunity to get around 
to all of the local groups, mainly 
because of the geographic size of 
the region. However, I do provide 
these local user groups with infor- 
mation that is important for all 
Software AG users. 

In the event that you receive the 
magazine before the next Midwest 
Region meeting it will be held on 
September 12, 1989, in  Milwaukee, 
Wisconsin. You can contact me 
for information about the exact lo- 
cation and time. 

NORTHWEST REGION 

ADABAS 5 
Compared to 
version 4 
Loretta Eaves 
State of Washington 

The June 2,  1989, meeting of the 
Northwest Region was attended by 
47 members and guests represent- 
ing 22 organizations. Topics in- 
cluded presentations and 
discussions on NATURAL 2.1 Local 
Data Area Editor, ADABAS 5, and 
ADABAS SQL. Presenters included 
Leo Webb of Washington State's 

Gerry Zeller from Elkay Mfg. pre- 
sented NATURAL 2 Map Process- 
ing Rules. Gerry has done extensive 
work with the map editor, process- 
ing rules and ranking of rules. We 

The Midwest Region has a number 
of local area SAG User that 
meet at times' 
Here is a list of the ones that I know 
about: 

Department of Information Ser- 
vices, R~~ young from software 
AGSs Denver office and Steve Brad- 
ley from Software AGjs Seattle of- 
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Leo walked us through steps to 
create Local Data Areas and Gobal 
Data Areas. He discussed how to 
define arrays and how to break up 
a field into sub-fields (reference: 
handout #I). 

Leo showed us some of the charac- 
teristics and commands within 
the data editor (reference: handout 
#2). 

Training classes announced 

Washington State Department of 
Information Services (DIS) and 
Software AG are offering several 
classes in the Olympia area. 

July 13-14 
ADABAS 5 capabilities 
$250 max. cost 

August 23-25 
ADABAS internals 
$375 max. cost 

August 15-17 
Sep. 20-22 
ADABAS & NATURAL 2 
Programming 
$350 

Since DIS is a non-profit service 
center costs will drop for classes if 
attendance is high. Organizations 
which are other than Washington 
State Government agencies, how- 
ever, must pay a $50lday surcharge. 

ADABAS 5, Ray Young from 
Software AG, Denver 

Ray discussed differenceslimprove- 
ments of ADABAS 5 compared to 

fice. Guests included a 
representative from the Rocky 
Mountain West Region SAGGROUP. 

Networking 

The hour between 8:00 and 9:00 
a.m. was used to network, revisit 
with old friends and get settled 
with coffee, juice and rolls. 

Brock Norman opened the meeting 
promptly at 9:00 a.m. and asked 
those in attendance to introduce 
themselves. 

NATURAL 2.1 Local Data Editor 

Brock introduced Leo Webb who 
presented an overview of a class he 
is developing for his organization. 
He briefly discussed the three edi- 
tors (map, program, data) and in  
response to a question on syntax 
from the group, noted that all the 
editors use the same syntax and 
edit commands. 

version 4. Topics discussed 
included: 

Hold Queue 
restricts programmer to no more 
than 114 of total queue 

Parm definitions and effects on 
programmers 

Field level changes 
floating point format, superlsub- 
fields, superisub-descriptors, 
hyperdescriptors 

Command Enhancements 
search, read, update, openiclose 

Other Improvements 
Space reusage (inverted lists) 
Buffer flush mechanics (p 25) 
buffer ~ o o l  enlarged (header still 
below 16 meg) 

GET NEXT Processing (p 6) 
prefetch invoked at control block 

level 
search criteria optimization 
format change translation 

estimate 

Format Buffer Syntax for record 
typing (P 8) 

Use of Format PoolIGlobal Com- 
mand ID (p 9) 

Search Algorithms 
return of algorithm 3 

Soft Coupling (p 18) 
functionality of physical cou- 
pling without overhead of cou- 
pling lists 

Performance Strategies 
increased user defined block 

sizes 
better buffer efficiency 
priority of commands 
ET blocking 

Other topics covered in handout 
not discussed due to time limita- 
tions include: 

buffer flush timing algorithm 

access commands may continue 
after buffer flush 

change in hold queue manager 

Ray specifically recommended us- 
ing no lower than sm-3 of ADABAS 
5 and announced that sm-4 is due 
out this summer. 

After lunch Ray fielded questions 
of general interest from the group. 

Migration Aids 
the general feeling was "avoid" 

If invert goes bad, must restore 
the file; problem is being 
addressed 

No more two-step utilities, all 
one-step 

Checkpoint file 
should be considered off-limits, 
as should all system files 

(Page numbers reference handout) 

Elections 

Current officers agreed to nomina- 
tions for another year. No other 
nominations were offered. All were 
elected unanimously. 

Training Coordinator: 
Leo Webb 

Secretary: 
Loretta Eaves 

Program Coordinator: 
Tom Thomas 

Regional Representative: 
Brock Norman 

Brock notified the group that he is 
running for Vice President of the 
Executive Committee. If he gets 
that position, he will vacate the 
NWSAGGROUP Regional Represen- 
tative position. 

Steve Bradley discusses 
ADABAS SQL 

Topics discussed included: 

Application concerns 
productivity 
maintainability 
performance 

History of SQL 

Definition of SQL-relational data- 
base for: 

Data Manipulation 
Data definition 
Data security 
Ad Hoc query 

SQL components 
relational DBMS 
Language components 

DDL, DML, DCL 

Data types 
character, numeric, floating 

point 

Data manipulation language for 
3GL applications 

Steve displayed samples of code 
illustrating basic coding structures. 

NOTE: Copies of handouts and 
overviews referred to in the meet- 
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ing notes may be obtained from the 
NWSAGGROUP Secretary: 

Loretta Eaves 
(206) 586-4578 
Washington State Department of 
Licensing 
Highways-Licenses Bldg, 
MIS PB-01 
Olympia, WA 98504 

SIERRA PACIFIC REGION 

Sheri Kosh 
Speaks on Future 
Training Needs 
The June meeting was held June 5 
at the Lake Tahoe Inn in  South 
Lake Tahoe. Fifty people attended 
representing twenty-five users. 

During the business session Ronna 
Slobe reminded us of the Change1 
Enhancement Form that is in the 
back of the Connections Magazine. 
If you are interested, please fill 
out and send to Ronna. Next SPUG 
Meeting will be September 12th 
at Dole Foods in  San Francisco. 

Next Collette Farabaugh from Dole 
Foods spoke regarding the Execu- 
tive Committee Meeting she at- 
tended in Denver in May: 

1. Reminder of the Users' Confer- 
ence in Anaheim October 2 2  
thru 26. The cost is $875.00 be- 
fore August 15th. Get reserva- 
tions early. Some things that 
will make the conference better 
this year are the Bulletin Boards 
for different groups; Demo 
Rooms and more classes and 
presentations than last year. 

2. Nominations will be open for 
officers: Vice President D. B. 
Functional Area Rep; Commu- 
nications Area Rep; and End- 
User Area Rep. Also needed are 
advisory people to feed informa- 
tion to the Functional Area Reps. 
If interested contact Collette or 
your Functional Area Rep. 

3. Some areas of interest brought 
out were: 

Software AG is receiving 
9,000 calls each month on 
NATURAL 2 which is resulting 
in some delays. 

Service Connection is currently 
in BETA Test. It will be released 
before The Users' Conference. 

The ChangeIEnhancement Form 
goes to Kelly Jones then to your 
Functional Area Rep. and then to 
Software AG. It is not to be used 
for problem reporting.Once each 
year you may then vote on the 
topics you wish to be placed on 
the priority list to be addressed 
during the next year. 

Sheri Kosh of Software AG spoke 
about future training. Jack Hauber 
is the new Training Director and 
is located at the Reston Corporate 
Office. His phone number is 703- 
860-5050. Software AG plans to 
expand the scope of training for 
quality and quantity. Sheri asked 
"What are your needs?", "What do 
you want from us?", "Any com- 
plaints?". Some answers she had to 
previous questions are: Some new 
classes will be "ADABAS 
INTERNALS "; "ADABAS 
COMMAND"; "LOG ANALYSIS"; 
"SYSTEM DESIGN"; and 
"REVIEW". There will  be more 
classes coming up  at HWDC and 
"package training" which will al- 
low you to take 4 classes at a re- 
duced rate. 

Ronna Slobe spoke again to remind 
us of the NATURAL 2 Conference 
in Boston in June 1990. If interested 
contact Ronna for an information 
packet. Ronna also stated that in  
the future she would like User 
Presentations at the meetings. 

The rest of the meeting entailed an 
excellent presentation by Sheri 
Kosh on NATURAL SECURITY. 

CENTRAL CANADIAN REGION 

Central Canada 
Launches Users' 
Group 
Dunc Anderson 
Investors Group 

You will be pleased to know that to 
date we have had two Central Can- 
ada SAGGROUP meetings. 

The first meeting which was held 
on April 28, 1989 was hosted by 
Investors Group. The meeting was 
attended by 35 members represent- 
ing 6 organizations. 

The second meeting which was 
held on June 23, 1989 was hosted 
by the Family Services Department 

of the Manitoba Government. This 
meeting was attended by 33 mem- 
bers representing 6 organizations. 

As you can appreciate the purpose 
of the first meeting was to launch 
the group and to introduce the 
member organizations to each 
other. 

Something else I organized was a 
luncheon with selected members 
from the various organizations with 
the view of soliciting support. 

I am pleased to report that this 
resulted in  the following people 
volunteering for the positions 
indicated. 

President 
Chris Baschuk 
Data Base Administrator 
United Grain Growers 
433 Main Street 
Winnipeg, MB, Canada 
R3C 1B3 

Vice-President 
(Program-Coordinator) 
Chris Aune 
Manitoba Family Services 
615-300 Graham Avenue 
Winnipeg, MB, Canada 
R3C 4A5 

Secretary 
Michael Langedock 
Supervisor, Application 

Programming 
Gendis Business Services 
1370 Sony Place 
Winnipeg, MB, Canada 
R3C 3C4 

This slate of officers for the Central 
Canada SAGGROUP Region was 
presented at the June 23, 1989 
meeting and was accepted 
unanimously, 

A set of by-laws was drafted for 
this new region. 

It would appear from the first two 
meetings and also the response to 
fill the executive positions that 
another SAGGROUP Region has 
been launched. 

I would like to thank Larry Jayne, 
the SAGGROUP Executive and Jim 
Hill for their support i n  the 
launching of our new Central Can- 
ada Region. 



Software AG Product Status Report 
Software AG offers this Product 
Status Report, updated quarterly, as 
a regular feature of Connections in 
order to advise our customers 
which products we have released 
recently and which are scheduled 
for release in the near future. 

Our goal is to provide you with 
products that perform as you expect 
them to perform, and that can 
sometimes mean a delay in releases 
while last-minute bugs are fixed or 
changes are incorporated. It is, 
therefore, important to note that all 
target release dates are as accurate 
as possible at press time, but are 
subject to change without notice. 

Released: January 1989 to 
September 1989 

Data BaselDictionary 
Products Date of Release 

Versions 

ADABAS SQL 1.3 January 1989 
NATURAL ARCHITECT April 1989 

Workstation 1.1.0 
ADABAS HPE 1.1.0 July 1989 
ADABAS TPF 4.4.3 July 1989 
ADABAS TRS 1.2 May 1989 

Application Development 
Products Date of Release 

NATURAL Optimizer 

CMS 
DOS 

February 1989 
February 1989 

Versions 

NATURAL 2.1.4 February 1989 
NATURAL SECURITY January 1989 

2.1.4 
NATURAL VSAM 2.1.4 February 1989 
NATURAL Graphics March 1989 

2.1.4 
NATURAL DL1 2.1.4 April 1989 
NATURAL 2.1.4 June 1989 

Fix Taae 1 

Versions Date of Release 

ADABAS VSAM Limited Release 
Bridge 3.1.1 By Request Only 

NATURAL SECURITY 2.1.4 August 1989 
Fix Tape 1 

NATURAL 2.1.4 September 1989 
Fix Tape 2 

Communications 
Products 

VM-PASS 1.1.0 
COM-PLETE 4.4.3 

MVSIXA 

Date of Release 

April 1989 

March 1989 
DOS April 1989 

User Services 
Versions Date of Release 

SUPER NATURAL 2.3 July 1989 
NATURAL CONNECTION May 1989 

(Mainframe) 2.1.4 ' NATURAL Document June 1989 
36 Management 1.1.1 

NATURAL Elite June 1989 
ADABAS 5 Direct Calls 

CON-NECT 2.2.1 August 1989 
NATURAL Elite August 1989 

ADABAS 5 Fundamentals 
NATURAL Elite September 1989 

PREDICT Fundamentals 
NATURAL Elite August 1989 

CON-NECT 
Time Management 

Data Center 
Version Date of Release 

REVIEW 3.1 January 1989 

VAX 
Version Date of Release 

NATURAL 1.4 February 1989 
ADABAS 1.5.1 March 1989 
NATURAL Graphics 1.0.0 April 1989 
NATURAL Professional April 1989 

1.0.0 
NATURAL SECURITY April 1989 

1.0.0 
NATURAL Architect April 1989 

Workstation 1.1 
NATURAL CONSTRUCT May 1989 

1.2 
PREDICT 1.1 May 1989 
SUPER NATURAL 2.1.2 May 1989 
NATURAL Elite September 1989 

Extended 1.3 
ADABAS 1.5.2 August 1989 
NATURAL Elite September 1989 

Basic 1.3.0 

Scheduled for Release: 
September 1989 to First Quarter 
1990 

Data BaselDictionary 
Versions 

NET-WORK 5 
beta test 
Target release: First Quarter 1990 

ADABAS SQL 1.4 
beta test 
Target release: First Quarter 1990 

ADABAS 5.1.4 
beta test 
Target release: Third Quarter 1989 

Application Development 
Products 

NATURAL SQLIDS 
beta test 
Target release: December 1989 

PREDICT CASE 
beta test 
Target release: First Quarter 1990 

Versions 

NATURAL CONSTRUCT 2.2.1 
beta test 
Target release: September 1989 

NATURAL DB2 1.3.1 
beta test 
Target release: September 1989 

NATURAL ARCHITECT Workstation 1.2.1 
beta test 
Target release: September 1989 

Communications 
NET-PASS 2.2.1 

beta test 
Target release: Third Quarter 1989 

User Services 
Products 

NATURAL Spreadsheet 
beta test 
Target release: Third Quarter 1989 

NATURAL Statistical Link 
beta test 
Target release: Third Quarter 1989 

Versions 

CON-NECT 2.2.2 
beta test 
Target release: October 1989 

NATURAL Elite Basic System 1.4.2 
beta test 
Target release: October 1989 

NATURAL DOCUMENT 
MANAGEMENT 1.2 

beta test 
Target release: December 1989 

ADABAS TRS 1.3 
beta test 
Target release: December 1989 

NATURAL Elite ADABAS 5 File Design 1.1 
beta test 
Target release: November 1989 

NATURAL Elite NATURAL Structured 
Design 1.1 

beta test 
Target release: December 1989 

NATURAL CONNECTION for the Macintosh 1 .I 
beta test 
Target release: November 1989 

NATURAL CONNECTION PC 3.2 
beta test 
Target release: First Quarter 1990 

Data Center 
Pmducts 

NATURAL PROCESS 1.2.1 
beta test 
Target release: December 1989 

NATURAL OPERATIONS 
beta test 
Target release: December 1989 

NATURAL ISPF 
alpha test 
Target release: Fourth Quarter 1989 

VMS Products 
NET-WORK 2.1 

In Development 
Target release: First Quarter 1990 

ADABAS 2.1 
beta test 
Target release: Fourth Quarter 1989 

NATURAL 1.4.2 
beta test 
Target release: October 1989 

NATURAL Elite Intyo to NATURAL 
beta test 
Target release: October 1989 



Software AG Users' Group Tools Request Form 
REQUEST 
Any licensed user of Software AG products may request a copy of the DBA (for ADABAS & NATURAL) Tools or the 
COM-PLETE Tools. 
Complete the information below and send to: Users' Group Liaison, Software AG of North America, Inc. 

11190 Sunrise Valley Drive, Reston, VA 22091 USA 
Users Outside the U.S. send to: 
Your Software AG Distributor or Affiliate. 

Send: 17 DBA Tools Tape (for non-DOS users) DOS DBA Tools Tape (for DOS users) COM-PLETE Tools 
Tape VMS DBA Tools Tape 

Note-Both of the above DBA and DOS DBA Tools tape contain the same set of tools. The only difference is the 
DOS DBA Tools tape is DOS readable. 

Ship to: (Please type or print) 

Name - 

Organization - 

Address - 

- 

City State 

Zip Country P.O. # 

Bill To: (A cost of $50.00 U.S. and $75 International is charged for each of the above tapes that are shipped.) 

Send invoice to SHIP TO name above Send invoice to person below (Please type or print) 

Name - 

Organization 

Address 

City State 

Zip Country P.O. # 

Customer Number 

Change of Address Form 
Check One: 

Change of Address (attach old label) 
Add New Name 
Delete Current Name (attach old label) 

U.S. Users Send to: 
Manager, Customer Relations 
Software AG of North America, Inc. 
11190 Sunrise Valley Drive 
Reston, VA 22091 

Users Outside the U.S. Send to: 
Your Software AG Distributor or Affiliate 

E I e  -1 11171II1 & 
Your 
Title 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1  

Company 
Name 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1  

Street 
1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1  

Street 
2 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1  

Street 
3 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 l  

Country 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 l 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 I  
Customer Number 0 1 7 0 ~ ~ ~ 0  



Software AG Users' Group 
Regions in the United States 

. 

Western Canada 
Central Canada 

Eastern Canada 

Northeastern 

Southwestern 

Alaska Region 

This map represents changes 
made in the United States 
regional Users' Group boun 
daries at the International 
Conference 



ChangelEnhancement Form 

DATA BASE 

ADABAS 
ADABAS ONLINE SERVICES 
ADABAS VSAM BRIDGE 
ADABAS DL1 BRIDGE 
ADABAS TOTAL BRIDGE 
ADABAS CICS INTERFACE 
ADABAS IMSIDC INTERFACE 
ADABAS TSO INTERFACE 
ADABAS REFLECTIVE DATA BASE 
ADABAS TEXT RETRIEVAL SYSTEM 
ADABAS REVIEW 
ADABAS VM 
ADABAS CONVERT 

APPLICATION DEVELOPMENT 

ADABAS SQL 
NATURAL-ADABAS 
NATURAL-DB2 
NATURAL-VSAM 
NATURAL GRAPHICS 
NATURAL OPTIMIZER COMPILER 
NATURAL CONSTRUCT 

ADMINISTRATION 

PREDICT 
PREDICT CASE 
NATURAL SECURITY 
NATURAL PROCESS 
NATURAL OPERATIONS 
COM-PLETE SECURITY 

COMMUNICATIONS 

ADABAS HPE 
ADABAS TPF PROCESSOR 
ADABAS VTAM 
NATURAL ADVANCED UTILITIES 
COM-PLETE PROCESSOR 
COM-PLETE UTILITIES 
COM-PLETE CICS INTERFACE 
COM-PLETE TSO INTERFACE 
COM-PLETE IMSIDC INTERFACE 
COM-PLETE VTAM INTERFACE 
NET-WORK INTERLINK (IBM) 
NET-WORK HYPERCHANNEL (IBM) 
NET-WORK CTCS 
NET-PASS 
NET-WORK DECNET 

END USER 

NATURAL SUPER NATURAL 
NATURAL ELITE EXTENDED FUNCTIONS 
NATURAL ELITE BASIC FUNCTIONS 
NATURAL ELITE COURSEWARE 
NATURAL CONNECTION MAINFRAME 
NATURAL DOCUMENT MANAGEMENT FACILITY 
CON-NECT STANDALONE 
CON-NECT 
CON-NECT DOCIJMENT RETRIEVAL 
NATURAL ARCHITECT WORKSTATION 
NATURAL PROFESSIONAL 

Request Title: 

Request Description: - 

Request Benefits: 

Submitted by- Company: 

Name: Address: 

Customer ID Number: 

Telephone: - 

NOTE: Instructions for completing are on the back of this form. 



$*ructions for ChangelEnhancement Form 
1. Place one 'X' to the left of a product. This indicates the Product to which this ChangelEnhancement belongs. This groups similar 
: ChangelEnhancements together. 
2. Enter a Request Title which is a one line description for your ChangelEnhancement that is less than 40 characters. 

43. Enter a description for your ChangelEnhancement. Please be specific when describing your ChangelEnhancement. 
29. Enter an explanation of the benefits of the ChangelEnhancement. 
5.  Enter information about yourself so someone can contact you if there is some question about your ChangelEnhancement 

(you must include your telephone number) 

Leaseway National Service Corporation 
3700 Park East Drive 
Beachwood, OH 44122 USA 

M'PLICATION COMMUNICATIONS Tools SAG Group 
DEVELOPMENT 

Mr. Ed Simon 
Management Applied Program Business1 Industry 

Special Interest 3415 south Sepulveda ~ l v d .  Group (BIGS) 
Chairpersons Suite 200 Los Angeles, CA 90034 University & College BIG 

Ken Blythe NATURALIDB2 (213) 397-7220 
- bfr Ron Parker Mr Edward Lee Penn State 

31 Shields Building Mass. Institute of Technology State of Texas 
Comptroller's Dept University Park, PA 16802 

77 Massachusetts Ave. 
(814) 865-0481 LBJ State Office Building 

111 East 17th Street ADMINISTRATION 
Austin, TX 78774 Special Interest 
(512) 463-4856 Utility Company BIG Group 
NATURAL SECURITY Chairpersons Vacant 
Ms Mary C. Albano 
M.I.T. PREDICTlData Dictionary 
400 Main Street Thomas L. Visher State and Local 

Foremost Insurance Company G~~~~~~~~~ BIG 
Cambridge, MA 02139 P.O. Box 2450 MS.  0215 

360 West 31st Street Vacant 
New York, NY 10001 (617) 253-5398 5800 Foremost Drive S E 

NATURAL Tips & Techniques Grand Rapids, 49501 

Mr. Darrell Davenport (616) 942-3607 
EducationlDocumentation Washington State University Finance and Cash 

Management BIG 
Administrative Computing Mr. David Dmytryk 

Services Export Development 
Large Data Bases Pullman, WA 99164 END USER Corporation 

(509) 335-7316 
Special Interest Cash Management 

and Department 
Mr. Lew Levy 
RPMS 

Group Box 655 
Chairpersons Ottawa, Canada KIP 5T9 oremost Insurance Company 1588 Main Street, Unit #5 (613) 598-2862 

'.O. Box 2450 W. Warwick, RI 02893 NATURALlElite 
5800 Foremost Drive, S.E. (401) 464-3114 Mr. Tony Cortese Justice Related Organizations 
;rand Rapids, MI 49501 EG&G Florida BIG 

COMMUNICATION p.0 BOX 21 267 ~ g t  G Baerken 

ScientificlEngineering Special Interest BOC-029 Victoria Police 
Mr. Thomas Galloway Kennedy Space Center, FL Computer Systems Division 

Pratt & Whitney Aircraft 
Group 32815 412 St. Kilda Road 

P.O. Box 2691 Chairpersons (407) 867-4530 South Melbourne 
Nest Palm Beach, FL 33402 COM-PLETE Performance SUPER NATURAL Australia 3205 
407) 796-2000 and Tuning Ms Christine Burback Federal BIG 

VMS Products Mr. Gordon Murphy Waste Management, Inc. Mr Rod Phillips 

Mr. Michael Livingston University of North Texas 3003 Butterfield Road U S Dept. of Transportation 

University of Houston The Computing Center Oakbrook, IL 60521 Federal Aviation Administration 
P.O. Box 13495 (312) 572-8784 6500 S. MacArthur Blvd. 

356 E. Cullen Bldg. Denton, TX 76203 P.0 Box 25082, AAC-312 
I I 

Houston, TX 77204 (817) 565-2324 
NATURAL Oklahoma City, OK 7312 3 
Mr. Clayton Clendinen 

(713) 749-7121 Orlando Utilities 
500 Orange Avenue 
Orlando, FL 32801 

i 
(407) 236-9645 



I Executive 

President 
MI William Wagner 
University of Texas at Austln 
Data Processing Division 
Box Q 
University Station 
Austin, TX 78713 
(512) 471-0011 
Vice President 
Ms. Colette Farahaugh 
Dole Packaged Foods Co 
50 California Street 
San Francisco, CA 94111 
(415) 773-4854 
Secretarv 
Mr. ~ a r j  Godec 
Dr. Pepper 
P.0. BOX 65086 
Dallas, TX 75265-5086 
[214) 360-7308 
Past President 
Mr Carlo Scagnelli 1 Central Hudson Gas & Electric, Inc 
284 South Avenue 
Poughkeepsie. NY 12602 
(914) 486-5641 
Data Base Product Representative 

* Mr. Robert Becker 
Foremost Insurance Company 
P 0 BOX 2450 
5800 Foremost Drive S.E 
Grand Rap~ds, MI 49501 
(616) 956-2664 
Application Development Product Repi 
Mr James T Wisdom 
Boston University 
881 Commonwealth Avenue 
3rd Floor 
Boston, MA 02215 
(617) 353-2280 
Communications Product Representati~ 
Ms. Ellen Birch 
Price Waterhouse & Company 
6500 Rock Spring Drive 
Sulte 600 
Bethesda, MD 20817 
(301) 493-2637 
Administration Product Representative 
Ms Patricia A Plccola 
BP Exploration 
5151 San F e l i ~ e  
P.O. Box 458f 
Houston, TX 77210-4587 
(7131 552-6017 
End User Product Representative 
Ms Laura Jacobs 
Rochester Institute of Technology 
Technical Support-Bldg 10 
1 Lomb Memorial Drive 
Rochester, NY 14623 
(716) 475-2973 
ChaueeiEnhancement Coordinator 
Mr.  ill^ Jones 
Leaseway National Service Corporation 
3700 Park East Drive 

I Beachwood, OH 44122 
(216) 765-5659 
Manager. Customer Relations 
Mr. ~ a k ~  Jayne 
Software AG of North America, Inc. 
11190 Sunrise Vallev Drive 
Reston, VA 22091 
(703) 860-5050 
Technical Support Evaluation 
Mr. Richard Golden 
Louisiana Gas Service Company 
1233 Westbank Expressway 
P.O. Box 433 
Harvey, LA 70059 
(504) 368-8675 
NominationsiElections 
Ms Mary Ellen Woods 
Inland Steel 
3210 Wading Street 
East Chicago, IN 46312 
(219) 399-7686 

1 Editors 
Mr. Larry Jayne 
Manager, Customer Relations 
Software AG of North America, Inc 
11190 Sunrise Valley Drive 
Reston, VA 22091 
(703) 860-5050 

Ms. Pamela Ellis 
Editor 
Software AG of North America, Inc 
11190 Sunrlse Valley Drive 
Reston, VA 22091 
(703) 860-5050 
Mr. Jim Wisdom, Application Development 
Product Representative and Contributing Editor 
Mr. Robert Becker, Data Base 
Product Representatwe and Contrlbutlng Editor 
Ms. Ellen Birch, Commumcations 
Product Representative and Contrlbutlng Editor 
Ms. Patricia A. Piccola, Administration 
Product Representative and Contributing Editor 
Ms. Laura Jacobs, End User 
Product Representatme and Contribut~ng Editor 

Area Representative 
North American Area 

'esentative 

European and Middle Eastern Area 
Vacant 
South African Area 
Mr Willem J Swanepoel 
Johannesburg Consolidated Investment Co , 
Limited 
PO. Box 590 
2000 Johannesburg, South Africa 
(011) 373-9117 
South American Area 
Salvador De Oliveira, r 
Telecomunic6es Brasdeiras SiA-Telebras 
Departamento De Apolo Em Informatica 
Sas Quadra 06-Conjunto Sede 
Brasha-DF-70313 
Brazil 
Oceania Area 
Mr Bryan Fitzpatrick 
Australian Bureau of Statistics 
P.O. Box 10 
Belconnen, A.C.T. 2616 
Australia 
(062) 52-6589 
Asian Area 
Mr Sadayuki Takehana 
Dlrector 
Information Systems Department 
Nikon Corporation 
3-2-3 Marunouchi, Chiyoda-Ku 
Toyko 100 Japan 
(03) 216-1033 

Regional Reps 
Delaware Valley Region 
Mr. David A. Tones 
CIGNA 
#4 Echelon Plaza 
Laurel Road 
Voorhees, NJ 08043 
(609) 770-6779 
Eastern Region 
Mr Robert Comstock 
PRCiFSD 
1505 Planning Research Drlve 
TM 3515 
McLean. VA 22102 
(703) 883-8385 
Eastern Great Lakes Region 
Ms Nancy Simonds 

ochester Institute of Technolog 
ldg. 10-ISC Dept. Room 331 

Lomb Memorial Drive 2 
Rochester, NY 
(716) 475%-3+& 
Hawaiian Region 
Mr. Terry Ledford 
Royal State Corporation -) 

819 South Beretania Street 
Honolulu, HI 96813 
Mideastern Reeion 
Ms. Margaret Bish 
Polygram Records, Inc 
6220 Churchman Bypass 
Indianapolis, IN 46203 

Midwestern Region 
Mr. John DeNatale 
Elkay Manufacturing Company 
2700 S. 17th Avenue 
Broadview, IL 60153 
(312) 681-1880 

New a n d  R e g  Australia 
Mr. Rick Wahlberg l l p l f ~ l  Mr. Peter Bickerton 
Brown University Australian Wheat Board 
P 0 .  Box 1885 Ceres House 
115 Waterman Stre t Lonsdale Street 
Providence, RI 02912 %@ Melbourne, Vic 3001 
(401) 863-7353 Australia 
Northeastern Reeiun I - , , (03) 6051-655 
Mr. Len Berger " r/ Brazil 
NMU Pension & Welfare Plan Jor e Leiria De Almeida 
360 West 31st Street fib ~ r a t m a  Data Processamento Ltda 
New York NY 10001 8- DivisZo De Banco De Dados 
(212) 337-i956 ! Rua Almirante Cochrane 146, 2nd 
Northwestern ~e~~ 
Mr. Brock Norman 

PT.T (Post, Telecom, Telegraph) 
Portland, (503) 220-3987 OR 97207 ,,- / Prinses Beatrixlaan 16 

2595 Al'S-Gravenhase 
Pacific Southwestern Region 
Mr. Tim Kline 
Systemhouse 
18000 Studebaker Road 
4th Floor 
Cerritos, CA 90701 
(213) 860-3635 
Rocky Mountain-East Region 
Mr. Jim Keebaugh 
TRW Inc. 
1555 Newport Road 

(719) 570-8259 

4-f) 
Colorado Spnngs, CO 80916 

Rocky Mountain-West Region 
Mr. Patrick Kirby 
Idaho State Auditore riff. 
700 West State Str-0 , 
Boise, ID 83720 

9 
[W 
Sierra Pacific Region 
Ms. Ronna Slobe 
State of Nevada 
Blasdel Building 
Capitol Complex 

(702) 885-4091 

--@ 
Carson City, NV 89710 

Southeastern Region 
Mr. Clayton Clendinen 
Orlando Utilities Commission 

Orlando, FL 32801 

b% 
500 South Orange Avenue Z t p  

(407) 236-9645 
Southwestern Region - 
Mr. John Oborn 
US Sprint 
8113 Ridge Point Drive 
Suite 200 
Mail Stop SW 040 
Irving, TX 75063 

Eastern Canada Region 
Ms. Helen Cox 
North American L i f ~  
5650 Yonge Street I 

North York, Ontario M2M 4G4 
Canada 
(416) 229-4515 
and 
Ms Wendy Merkley 
Mercantile & General Reinsur 
University Place 
123 Front Street, W. 

Canada 
(416) 947-3800 

4 0  Toronto, Ontario M5J 2M7 

. 
Western Canada Region 
Mr. Ron Hunt 
Alberta Solicitor General 4.- 
8th Floor 
Tohn E. Brownlee Building ' 
10365-97 Street 

- 
Edmonton, Alberta T5J 3W7 
Canada 
(403) 427-0366 

Central Canada Region 
Mr Chris Baschuk 
United Grain Growers 
433 Main Street 

Canada 
Alaska Region 

Wmnipeg, Manitoba R3C 1B3 

Mr. Rodney Mitchell 
State of Alaska 
P 0 Box C-MS 0206 
State Office Building 
Juneau, AK 99811 
(907) 465-4818 

9. '1 
Argentina 
M l ~ u e l  M De San Vincent 
Acrndar 
Paseo Colon. 357 
Buenos ~ i r e s ,  Argentina 

- 
Belgium 
070-759111 
France 
Mr Louvain 
UTI Servlces 
9, Rue Laperouse 
75016 Paris, France 
1-7201020 
Germany 
Mr Bernd Moller 
Bertelsmann Datenverarheitung 
An der Autobahn 
4830 Gutersloh 
West Germany 
05241-802052 
Iberia 
Mr. Antonio Luis Alaaoa 
Lisnave 
Margueira 2800 
Almada, Portugal 

Israel 
Mr. David Tobias 
Bank Leumi Le' Israel BM. 
6 Yehuda Halevi Street 
Tel-Aviv, Israel 

1 Italy 
Ing. Giuseppe Vittori 
Technical Support Department 
c/o Philips S. p. A. 
Piazza IV 
Novembre. 3 
20124 Milano, Italv 
Japan and Far ~ a i t  Region 
Mr Sadayuki Takehana 
Director 
Information Systems Department 
Nikon Corporation 
3-2-3 Marunouchi. Chivoda-Ku 

(03) 216-1033 
New Zealand 
Mr. Malcolm H. McConnell 
Department of Labour 
Wellington 1 
New Zealand 
South Africa 
Mr. Bill McKimm 
Edgars Stores Limited 
PO. Box 100 
Crown Mines, 2025 Johannesburg 
South Africa 
(011) 839-9506 
Southeast Asia 
Mrs. Yum Hui Yuen 
Information Technology Manager 
Information Technolo y Departme 
Port of Singapore ~ u t t o r i t y  
PSA Building 
460 Alexandra Road, PSA Building 
Singapore 0511 
2747111 
Switzerland 
Mr. Dominique Renand 
Elektronisches Rechenzentrum 
de Bundesaerwaltung 
Holzikofenweg 8 
CH-3003 Berne. Switzerland 
(031) 618783 
United Kingdom 
Ms. Linda Myles 
Police National Computer Organiz, 
Horse Ferry House 
Dean Ryle Street 
London SWIP 2AW 
Luxembourg 
Mr Geor 0 t h  
Banque cfe Luxembourg 
103 Grand Rue 
Luxembourg 
0352-481414 

(01) 34-8081 ext: 403 



r Ohl DON'T WANT TO MISS- 





CORPORATE 
HEADQUARTERS 
m rn I 

Software AG 
of North America, Inc. 

11190 Sunrise Valley Drive 
Reston, Virginia 22091 

Telephone (703) 860-5050 
Telex 275301 

Software AG 

Dehmelstrasse 3 
D-6100 Darmstadt 

West Germany 
Telephone (49) 06151-504-0 

Telex (841) 4197104 

1 
L 5 SORWARE RG 

11190 Sunrise Vallev Drive 

U.S. Sales 

Atlanta 
Boston 
Chicago 
Cleveland 
Dallas 
Denver 
Detroit 
Houston 
Kansas City 
Los Angeles 
Minneapolis 
New York 
Northern New Jersey 
Philadelphia 
Pittsburgh 
Puerto Rico 
Rochester 
St. Louis 
San Francisco 
Seattle 
Washington, D.C. 

International 
Sales 

Argentina 
Australia 
Austria 
Belgium 
Brazil 
Canada 
Denmark 
Finland 
France 
Hong Kong 
Israel 
Italy 
Japan 
Korea 
Malaysia 
Mexico 

Middle East 
Netherlands 
New Zealand 
Norway 
Panama 
Phill ipines 
Singapore 
South Africa 
Spain 
Sweden 
Switzerland 
Tawaiin 
Turkey 
United Kingdom 
West Germany 
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